

ATTACHMENT A: PURCHASING PRICE FOR SPECIFIED SUPPLY ITEMS ITB #18-94 FOOD SERVICE PRODUCTS BID/OFFER SHEET								GULF COAST PAPER							LIBER HOLDINGS LLC						
ITEM	COUNTY ID	PREFERRED MFG NAME	ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	PKG	EST. ANNUAL QTY	PURCHASE UOM	MFG NAME	VENDOR PART #	MFG PKG	UOM	UOM PRICE	LUOM Available to Purchase	LUOM PRICE	MFG NAME	VENDOR PART #	MFG PKG	UOM	UOM PRICE	LUOM Available to Purchase	LUOM PRICE
1.0 FOOD SERVICE																					
1.1	6337	Reynolds	625	ALUMINUM FOIL, EXTRA HEAVY DUTY (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	18"X1000' RL	13	RL	BOARDWALK	BWK7136	18'X1000"	RL	\$82.04	RL	\$82.04	NOVA	N181000H	1 Roll	ROLL	\$52.46	ROLL	
1.2	6338	Reynolds	632	ALUMINUM FOIL, EXTRA HEAVY DUTY (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	18"X500' RL	38	RL	BOARDWALK	BWK7134	18'X500"	RL	\$38.05	RL	\$38.05	EMPRESS	E70815	1 Roll	ROLL	\$32.99	ROLL	
1.3	6339	Concord	7X1210004	BAG, 7"X12" 4MIL POLY FLAT (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	1000/CS	10	CS					NO BID		NO BID							
1.4	6340	Specialty	1201	BAG, SANDWICH WAX PAPER, SQUARE-OPEN END, 3" x 1 3/4" x 6 1/2" (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	8/1000/CS	45	CS	SPECIALTY	1201	8/1000	PK	\$12.19	PK	\$12.19	FISCHER	508-105	2000 / cs	CASE	\$31.31	CASE	
1.5	6341	Reynolds	RS1011	BAG, RESEALABLE STORAGE GALLON SIZE (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	250/CS	2	CS	REYNOLDS	RS1011	250/CASE	CS	\$24.75	CS	\$24.75	FANTAPAK	ZP-STORAGE-GAL	250	CASE	\$11.56	CASE	
1.6	6342	Reynolds	RS78	BAG, RESEALABLE STORAGE QT 1.75MIL (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	500/CS	4	CS	ELKAY	F20708Q	500/CASE	CS	\$14.25	CS	\$14.25	FANTAPAK		500	CASE	\$11.26	CASE	
1.7	6343	Huck	10PPIB	BAG, ICE 10#, 11" X 21" PLAIN POLY (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	1000/CS	1	CS	ELKAY	10PPIB	1000/CASE	CS	\$50.73	CS	\$50.73	NO BID						
1.8	6344	Pactiv	TH10012	BOWL, 12 OZ WHITE SATIN PLACESETTER SATIN TABLEWARE (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	8/125 1M/CS	27	CS	PACTIV	YTH10012	8/25 1M/CS	CS	\$30.94	CS	\$30.94	DART	12BWWCR / 12BWWC	8 / 125 cs	CASE	\$24.50	CASE	
1.9	6345	Sterno	72XX	CAN FUEL, JELLED 6 HOURS (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	CS	5	CS					NO BID		NO BID	NO BID						
1.10	6346	Solo	EAD15	DISPENSER, CUP ADJUSTABLE STAINLESS STEEL, PULL TYPE FOR 4-155 CUPS (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	EA	2	EA					NO BID		NO BID	NO BID						
1.11	6389	DART	8J8	CUPS, 8 OZ STYROFOAM (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	1M/CS	23	CS	DART	8J8	1M/CASE	CS	\$23.24	CS	\$23.24	Dart	8J8	25 / 40 cs	CASE	\$23.07	CASE	
1.12	6347	DART	10J10	CUPS, 10 OZ STYROFOAM (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	1M/CS	5	CS	DART	10J10	1M/CASE	CS	\$29.72	CS	\$29.72	Dart	10J10	25 / 40 cs	CASE	\$29.36	CASE	
1.13	6348	DART	12J12	CUPS, 12 OZ STYROFOAM (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	1M/CS	117	CS	DART	12J12	1M/CS	CS	\$33.06	CS	\$33.06	Dart	12J12	25 / 40 cs	CASE	\$32.71	CASE	
1.14	6350	DART	14J16	CUPS, 14 OZ STYROFOAM (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	1M/CS	6	CS	DART	14J16	1M/CS	CS	\$43.44	CS	\$43.44	Dart	14J16	25 / 40 cs	CASE	\$42.92	CASE	
1.15	6387	DART	16J16	CUPS, 16 OZ STYROFOAM (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	1M/CS	22	CS	DART	16J16	1M/CS	CS	\$47.69	CS	\$47.69	Dart	16J16	25 / 40 cs	CASE	\$47.26	CASE	
1.16	6351	Solo	SO-42BR	CUPS, CONE WATER CUP ROLLEDRIM, 4-1/4 OZ (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	200/PK 5M/CS	6	CS	SOLO	42RCON	200/PK 5M/CS	CS	\$48.34	CS	\$48.34	Konie	4.5KR	25 / 200 cs	CASE	\$47.62	CASE	
1.17	6388	Solo	4BB	CUPS, 4 OZ CONICAL WATER CUP, (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	5M/CS	1	CS					NO BID		NO BID	Konie	4KR	25 / 200 cs	CASE	\$47.62	CASE	
1.18	6612	DART	5N25	CUPS, 5 OZ. PLASTIC TRANSLUCENT (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	2M/CS	1	CS	DART	5N25	2M/CS	CS	\$46.25	CS	\$46.25	Empress	EK5A	25 / 100 cs	CASE	\$48.15	CASE	
1.19	6352	DART	7N25	CUPS, 7 OZ PLASTIC TRANSLUCENT (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	200/PK 2M/CS	1	CS	DART	7N25	200PK 5M/CS	CS	\$62.27	CS	\$62.27	Empress	EK7A	25 / 100 cs	CASE	\$52.75	CASE	
1.20	6353	Dixie	DIX15CX	CUPS, BAKING PAPER (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	20/500	1	CS					NO BID		NO BID	NO BID						
1.21	6354	Dispozo	P5003PCSPKIT	PICPAK, SEN PARTY PACKS WITH KNIFE, FORK, SPOON, SALT & PEPPER, NAPKIN (INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED) (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	250/CS	22	CS	DISPOZO	P2503SP	250/CS	CS	\$19.55	CS	\$19.55	Empress	E176000	250 / cs	CASE	\$19.38	CASE	
1.22	6355	Galaxy	GLX 370L	GLOVES, FOOD POLY SERVING LINE, EMBOSSED, LARGE, CLEAR (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	10 BX/100	60	CS	TIDI	10473	10BX/100	CS	\$19.40	CS	\$19.40	IBS	GL-LARGE / P6003 - EA	1 box 10/100	BOX	\$6.01	BOX	
1.23	6356	Cellucap	HN500	HAIRNET, LT WT 15-DENIER SINGLE STRAND NYLON BLACK, 1/4" APERTURE 28" X-LARGE (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	10 BX/144	5	CS	CELLUCAP	HN500	10BX/144	CS	\$143.69	CS	\$143.69	NO BID						
1.24	6357	Dispozo	BPL-R29	LINER, PAN FULL SIZE, PARCHMENT PAPER (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	1M/CS	12	CS	BAYCRAFT	1010	1M/CS	CS	\$45.07	CS	\$45.07	Nova	N49-1 / 24051610000	1000	CASE	\$39.57	CASE	
1.25	6358	DART	10CPWQ	PLATES, 3 COMPARTMENT 10.25", STYROFOAM (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	125/500	14	CS	DART	CPHQ	4/125 500	CS	\$46.69	CS	\$46.69	Dart	10CPWCR / 10CPWC	4 / 125 cs	CASE	\$31.12	CASE	
1.26	6613	DART	9PWC	PLATES, DINNER, 9", STYROFOAM (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	4/125	12	CS	DART	9PRL	4/125 500	CS	\$39.53	CS	\$39.53	Dart	9PWCR / 9PWC	4 / 125 cs	CASE	\$20.35	CASE	
1.27	6359	Solo	SO-05700	SPOONS, MED WT PLASTIC, WHITE (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)	1M/CS	23	CS	DISPOZO	P1003	1M/CS	CS	\$10.21	CS	\$10.21	Empress	E175002	1000 / cs	CASE	\$7.07	CASE	

