

BIDDERS NAME ADDRESS CONTACT PERSON TELEPHONE NO. FAX NUMBER EMAIL			ORAFUL AMERICAS, INC. 120 DARLING DRIVE AVON, CT 06001 REBECCA CAVAZUTI 860-676-7100 860-676-7199 REBECCA.CAVAZUTI@ORAFOL.COM					AVERY DENNISON 7542 N. NATCHEZ AVE NILES, IL 60714 DAN ZAMPA 847-588-7206 877-214-0909 REFLECTIVE.BIDS@AVERYDENNISON.COM					NIPPON CARBIDE INDUSTRIES (USA) INC. 13856 BETTENCOURT ST. CERRITOS, CA 90703 PATSY MATSUDA 562-777-1810 562-777-1811 BIDS@NIKKALITE.COM					TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC. 3310-D FRICK RD. HOUSTON, TX 77066 RENEE CAMPBELL 281-448-7711 281-591-6827 RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM					OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. 11931 SR 93 N LOGAN, OH 43138 ROBBIE JENKS 800-523-8917 740-385-8917 ROB@OSBURNS.COM SALES@OSBURNS.COM					DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC 3809 S. 2ND ST. #D200 AUSTIN, TX 78704 VALERA BYRD 512-437-6499 512-361-0299 VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM				
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, CLASS 1, WITH PRESSURE SENSITIVE ADHESIVE BACKING			3M PRODUCT DIAMOND GRADE		ALTERNATE DIAMOND GRADE		3M PRODUCT DIAMOND GRADE		ALTERNATE DIAMOND GRADE		3M PRODUCT DIAMOND GRADE		ALTERNATE DIAMOND GRADE		3M PRODUCT DIAMOND GRADE		ALTERNATE DIAMOND GRADE		3M PRODUCT DIAMOND GRADE		ALTERNATE DIAMOND GRADE											
Pressure sensitive rolls, 36 inch wide, Diamond Grade	COMM CODE	ITEM ID	PRICE PER ROLL	PRODUCT CODE / LENGTH OF ROLL	MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL	PRICE PER ROLL	PRODUCT CODE / LENGTH OF ROLL	MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL	PRICE PER ROLL	PRODUCT CODE / LENGTH OF ROLL	MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL	PRICE PER ROLL	PRODUCT CODE / LENGTH OF ROLL	MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL										
GREEN	801-49	7228			ORAFOL 7900	\$787.50	50YD			Avery Dennison T-9507	\$679.50	36 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 92808	\$1,575.00	50 Yards	\$1,567.50	50 Yd			\$1,039.50	50 YDS									
YELLOW	801-49	7229			ORAFOL 7900	\$787.50	50YD			Avery Dennison T-9501	\$679.50	36 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 92804	\$1,575.00	50 Yards	\$1,567.50	50 Yd			\$1,039.50	50 YDS									
BROWN					ORAFOL 7900	\$787.50	50YD			Avery Dennison T-11509	\$679.50	36 in x 50 yd			NO BID			\$1,567.50	50 Yd			\$1,039.50	50 YDS									
RED	801-49	7230			ORAFOL 7900	\$787.50	50YD			Avery Dennison T-9508	\$679.50	36 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 92805	\$1,575.00	50 Yards	\$1,567.50	50 Yd			\$1,039.50	50 YDS									
WHITE	801-49	7231			ORAFOL 7900	\$787.50	50YD			Avery Dennison T-9500	\$679.50	36 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 92802	\$1,575.00	50 Yards	\$1,567.50	50 Yd			\$1,039.50	50 YDS									
BLUE	801-49				ORAFOL 7900	\$787.50	50YD			Avery Dennison T-9505	\$679.50	36 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 92806	\$1,575.00	50 Yards	\$1,567.50	50 Yd			\$1,039.50	50 YDS									
FLUORESCENT YELLOW/GREEN	801-49				ORAFOL 7900	\$1,012.50	50YD			Avery Dennison T-9513	\$742.50	36 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 92844	\$1,575.00	50 Yards	\$1,945.00	50 Yd			\$1,089.00	50 YDS									
FLUORESCENT ORANGE	801-49				ORAFOL 5930	\$1,012.50	50YD			Avery Dennison W-9514	\$742.50	36 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 92847	\$1,080.00	50 Yards	\$1,945.00	50 Yd			\$1,089.00	50 YDS									
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:																																
Pressure sensitive rolls, 36 inch wide, Engineer Grade	COMM CODE	ITEM ID	MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL			MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL			MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL			MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL												
WHITE	801-49		ORAFOL 5700	\$495.00	50YD			Avery Dennison T-1500-A	\$337.50	36 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 48012	\$387.00	50 Yards			3M	\$410.00	50 Yd												
BLACK	801-49		ORAFOL 5700	\$495.00	50YD			Do not carry black		36 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 48003	\$387.00	50 Yards			3M	\$505.00	50 Yd												
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:																																
					10 to 15	Additional Colors include: Yellow, Blue, Green, Red, Brown, Orange (\$337.50/roll 36 in x 50 yd roll)												14-21 Days						10-14 Days								
Pressure Sensitive Rolls, 24-inch Width Vinyl (Non-Reflective Vinyl)	COMM CODE	COUNTY ID#	MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL			MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL			MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL			MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL												
WHITE	801-49		ORAFOL 751	\$186.00	50YD			Avery Dennison SC900-108	\$174.00	24 in x 50 yd			NO BID					3M	\$395.00	50 Yd												
BLACK	801-49		ORAFOL 751	\$186.00	50YD			Avery Dennison SC900-190	\$174.00	24 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 4178	\$165.00	50 Yards			3M	\$395.00	50 Yd												
GREEN	801-49		ORAFOL 751	\$186.00	50YD			Avery Dennison SC900-770	\$174.00	24 in x 50 yd			NO BID					3M	\$395.00	50 Yd												
RED	801-49		ORAFOL 751	\$186.00	50YD			Avery Dennison SC900-430	\$174.00	24 in x 50 yd			NO BID					3M	\$395.00	50 Yd												
BLUE	801-49		ORAFOL 751	\$186.00	50YD			Avery Dennison SC900-680	\$174.00	24 in x 50 yd			NO BID					3M	\$395.00	50 Yd												
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:																																
					10 to 15													14-21 Days						10-14 Days								
Electro Cut (EC) Film, Non-Reflective with pressure sensitive adhesive, 24" WIDTH	COMM CODE	COUNTY ID#	MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL			MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL			MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL			MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL												
RED	801-49		ORAFOL 5061	\$255.00	50YD			Avery Dennison OL-2008	\$220.00	24 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 105	\$285.00	50 Yards			3M	\$395.00	50 Yd												
GREEN	801-49		ORAFOL 5061	\$255.00	50YD			Avery Dennison OL-2007	\$220.00	24 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 108	\$285.00	50 Yards			3M	\$395.00	50 Yd												
BROWN	801-49		ORAFOL 5061	\$255.00	50YD			Avery Dennison OL-2009	\$220.00	24 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 109	\$285.00	50 Yards			3M	\$395.00	50 Yd												
BLUE	801-49		ORAFOL 5061	\$255.00	50YD			Avery Dennison OL-2005	\$220.00	24 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 106	\$285.00	50 Yards			3M	\$395.00	50 Yd												
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:																																
					10 to 15													14-21 Days						10-14 Days								
Electro Cut (EC) Film, Non-Reflective with pressure sensitive adhesive, 36" WIDTH	COMM CODE	COUNTY ID#	MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL			MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL			MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL			MFG.	PRICE PER ROLL	LENGTH OF ROLL												
RED	801-49		ORAFOL 5061	\$382.50	50YD			Avery Dennison OL-2008	\$333.00	36 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 105	\$427.50	50 Yards			3M	\$505.00	50 Yd												
GREEN	801-49		ORAFOL 5061	\$382.50	50YD			Avery Dennison OL-2007	\$333.00	36 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 108	\$427.50	50 Yards			3M	\$505.00	50 Yd												
BROWN	801-49		ORAFOL 5061	\$382.50	50YD			Avery Dennison OL-2009	\$333.00	36 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 109	\$427.50	50 Yards			3M	\$505.00	50 Yd												
BLUE	801-49		ORAFOL 5061	\$382.50	50YD			Avery Dennison OL-2005	\$333.00	36 in x 50 yd			Nikkalite 106	\$427.50	50 Yards			3M	\$505.00	50 Yd												
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:																																
					10 to 15													14-21 Days						7-10 DAYS ARO								
APPLICATION TAPE (PRE-MASK)			3M PRODUCT	EQUIVALENT	3M PRODUCT	EQUIVALENT		3M PRODUCT	EQUIVALENT	3M PRODUCT	EQUIVALENT		3M PRODUCT	EQUIVALENT	3M PRODUCT	EQUIVALENT		3M PRODUCT	EQUIVALENT	3M PRODUCT	EQUIVALENT											
			MFG. NAME	ORAFOL				R-Tape		R-Tape								Avery		3m	Avery											
			PRODUCT NUMBER	MT95				At-65		At-75								4075-		AT 75		ipm										
			TAC LEVEL	Med				Med		Hi								Low		High		high										
			TYPE					PM		PM										plastic		plastic										
			UOM	RL				Price Per Square Foot		Price Per Square Foot								Roll		100 YDS		100yd										
			COMM CODE																													
			COUNTY ID#																													
1	832-69	3403		\$5.00				\$0.16/sqft		\$0.16/sqft			NO BID					\$5.20		\$22.75		\$4.95										
2 INCH	832-69			\$10.00				\$0.16/sqft		\$0.16/sqft			NO BID					\$10.40		\$22.75		\$8.50										
4 INCH	832-69	3401		\$20.00				\$0.16/sqft		\$0.16/sqft			NO BID					\$20.80		\$22.75		\$15.00										
8 INCH	832-69	3405		\$40.00				\$0.16/sqft		\$0.16/sqft			NO BID					\$41.60		\$29.75		\$29.25										
10 INCH	832-69			\$50.00				\$0.16/sqft		\$0.16/sqft			NO BID					\$52.00		\$36.75		\$35.00										
12 INCH	832-69	3407		\$60.00				\$0.16/sqft		\$0.16/sqft			NO BID					\$62.40		\$42.00		\$44.25										
18 INCH	832-69	3409		\$90.00				\$0.16/sqft		\$0.16/sqft			NO BID					\$93.60		\$63.00		\$63.50										
24 INCH	832-69	3412		\$120.00				\$0.16/sqft		\$0.16/sqft			NO BID					\$124.80		\$84.00		\$81.50										
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:																																
					10 to 15													14-21 Days						10-14 Days								
																								10-14 DAYS ARO								