

19-10 BARRICADE AND BARRICADE SHEETING			TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.			DOBIE SUPPLY LLC		
			3310-D FRICK ROAD			601 COMMERCIAL DR		
			HOUSTON, TX 77086			BUDA, TX 78610		
			281-448-7711			512-437-6499		
			281-591-6827			512-361-0299		
			<a href="mailto:renee@trantexinc.com">renee@trantexinc.com</a>			<a href="mailto:val@dobiesupply.com">val@dobiesupply.com</a>		
DESCRIPTION	SIZE	COUNTY ID#	MFG NAME	ORDER # MFG #	PRICE PER EACH	MFG NAME	ORDER # MFG #	PRICE PER EACH
<b>TYPE I</b>								
Verticle Panel (Verticade), stackable, with carry handle, low density polyethylene, orange & white reflective sheeting, 20 lb rubber base	8 X 36`	3959	Lakeside Plastics	VPOW HI20	\$49.50	PLASTICADE		\$39.50
Verticle Panel (Verticade), stackable, with carry handle, low density polyethylene, orange & white reflective sheeting, 30 lb rubber base	8 X 36`	3959	Lakeside Plastics	VPOW HI30	\$50.50	PLASTICADE		\$36.25
A Frame Barricade Set (Board & Frame- <b>one board</b> ) - Diamond Grade with <b>solid mold</b> legs			Plasticade	203W-A8DG	\$136.75	PLASTICADE		\$78.95
A Frame Barricade Set (Board & Frame- <b>two boards</b> ) - Diamond Grade with <b>solid mold</b> legs			Plasticade	2003W-A8DG	\$241.00	PLASTICADE		\$96.25
A Frame Barricade Set (Board & Frame- <b>one board</b> ) - Diamond Grade with <b>fillable</b> legs			Plasticade	200-A8DG	\$125.50	PLASTICADE		\$74.95
A Frame Barricade Set (Board & Frame- <b>two boards</b> ) - Diamond Grade with <b>fillable</b> legs			Plasticade	2002-A8DG	\$227.35	PLASTICADE		\$94.25
<b>TYPE II</b>								
Type II - 24" Width, Right or Left, plastic, orange & white or red & white reflective sheeting	24" / 2 FT TYPE II / PLASTIC	3878 / 3879	Plasticade	110-W-T888-HIP	\$74.00	PEXCO		\$59.00
<b>TYPE III</b>								
Type III - 72" Width, Right, Left or End of Road, plastic, orange & white or red & white reflective sheeting	72" / 6 FT TYPE III / PLASTIC	3890 / 3891 / 3892	Plasticade	TypeIII-72	\$270.00			\$132.50
Type III - 96" Width, Right, Left or End of Road, plastic rails 8" x 96", orange & white or red & white reflective sheeting, 14 Gauge tubing, 5' plastic supports	96" / 8 FT TYPE III / PLASTIC	3896 / 3897 / 3898	Plasticade	TypeIII-96	\$285.00			\$142.50
Type III Board, Plastic, high intensity retroreflective sheeting, polyethylene, "I" beam compatible	1" x 8" 6 FT		Plasticade	206-HIP	\$78.00	NO BID		
Type III Board, Plastic, high intensity retroreflective sheeting, polyethylene, "I" beam compatible	1" x 8" 8 FT		Plasticade	208-HIP	\$81.00	NO BID		
Type III Board, Plastic, high intensity retroreflective sheeting, polyethylene, "I" beam compatible	1" x 8" 10 FT		Plasticade	210-HIP	\$84.00	NO BID		
BARRICADE TAPE					PRICE PER EA	PRICE PER EA		
DESCRIPTION	COUNTY ITEM ID #		MFG NAME	MFG#		MFG NAME	MFG#	
AMBER / WHITE, LEFT, 6" STRIPE Diamond Grade Sheeting			Nikkalite	N517L6	\$275.00	AVERY		\$1,077.00
AMBER / WHITE, RIGHT, 6" STRIPE Diamond Grade Sheeting			Nikkalite	N517R6	\$275.00	AVERY		\$1,077.00
RED / WHITE, LEFT, 6" STRIPE Diamond Grade Sheeting			Nikkalite	N515L6	\$340.00	NO BID		
RED / WHITE, RIGHT, 6" STRIPE Diamond Grade Sheeting			Nikkalite	N515R6	\$340.00	NO BID		