

19-05 Road Safety Products - Signs and Posts - Aluminum Sign Blanks

BIDDERS NAME			VULCAN SIGNS			OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.			PATHMARK TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT, LLC			SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.			TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.			DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC		
ADDRESS			408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36536			11931 SR 93 N LOGAN, OH 43138			4435 HUNTER ROAD SAN MARCOS, TX 78666			8341 EPICENTER BLVD. LAKELAND, FL 33809			3310-D FRICK RD. HOUSTON, TX 77086			3809 S. 2ND ST. #D200 AUSTIN, TX 78704		
CONTACT PERSON			J. TODD KONIAR			ROBBIE JENKS			RICK BRUSHABER			DAVID VESPA			RENEE CAMPBELL			VALERA BYRD		
TELEPHONE NO.			800-633-6845			800-523-8917			800-547-0874			863-984-1385			281-448-7711			512-437-6499		
FAX NUMBER			251-943-1544			740-385-8016			512-392-2092			863-984-0058			281-591-6827			512-361-0299		
EMAIL			<a href="mailto:VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM">VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM</a>			ROBJ@OSBURNS.COM; SALES@OSBURNS.COM			<a href="mailto:BIDS@PATHMARK.NET">BIDS@PATHMARK.NET</a>			<a href="mailto:DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM">DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM</a>			<a href="mailto:RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM">RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM</a>			<a href="mailto:VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM">VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM</a>		
DESCRIPTION: 1.0 ALUMINUM SIGN BLANKS			PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN			PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN			PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN			PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN			PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN			PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN		
COMM CODE	COUNTY ID #		1 to 25	26 to 100	100 +	1 to 25	26 to 100	100 +	1 to 25	26 to 100	100 +	1 to 25	26 to 100	100 +	1 to 25	26 to 100	100 +	1 to 25	26 to 100	100 +
	801-09	7209	\$2.94	\$2.94	\$2.94	\$3.48	\$3.48	\$3.48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.15	\$3.05	\$2.95
6" X 24"																				
6" X 24" Green (both sides) no white border	801-09	9385	\$11.47	\$11.47	\$11.47	\$10.17	\$10.17	\$10.17	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.95	\$16.50	\$16.00
6" X 24" Brown (both sides)	801-09	9386	\$11.47	\$11.47	\$11.47	\$10.17	\$10.17	\$1.17	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.95	\$16.50	\$16.00
6" X 30"	801-09	7210	\$3.63	\$3.63	\$3.63	\$4.35	\$4.35	\$4.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.35	\$3.25	\$3.15
6" X 30" Green (both sides) no white border	801-09	9387	\$14.25	\$14.25	\$14.25	\$12.71	\$12.71	\$12.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.95	\$17.50	\$17.00
6" X 30" Brown (both sides)	801-09	9388	\$14.25	\$14.25	\$14.25	\$12.71	\$12.71	\$12.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.95	\$17.50	\$17.00
6" X 36"	801-09	7211	\$4.49	\$4.49	\$4.49	\$5.22	\$5.22	\$5.22	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.75	\$4.50	\$4.15
6" X 36" Green (both sides) no white border	801-09	9389	\$17.10	\$17.10	\$17.10	\$15.26	\$15.26	\$15.26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.95	\$18.50	\$18.00
6" X 36" Brown (both sides)	801-09	9390	\$17.10	\$17.10	\$17.10	\$15.26	\$15.26	\$15.26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.95	\$18.50	\$18.00
9" X 12"	801-09	7573	\$2.24	\$2.24	\$2.24	\$2.61	\$2.61	\$2.61	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.25	\$2.15	\$2.00
12" x 18"	801-09	837	\$4.46	\$4.46	\$4.46	\$5.22	\$5.22	\$5.22	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.85	\$4.65	\$4.50
18" x 18"	801-09	838	\$6.59	\$6.59	\$6.59	\$7.83	\$7.83	\$7.83	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.98	\$7.55	\$7.40
18" x 24"	801-09	839	\$8.79	\$8.79	\$8.79	\$10.44	\$10.44	\$10.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.05	\$9.95	\$9.75
24" x 24"	801-09	841	\$11.62	\$11.62	\$11.62	\$13.92	\$13.92	\$13.92	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.25	\$14.05	\$13.95
24" x 30"	801-09	1654	\$14.37	\$14.37	\$14.37	\$17.40	\$17.40	\$17.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.25	\$16.15	\$16.05
24" x 36"	801-09	2191	\$17.17	\$17.17	\$17.17	\$20.88	\$20.88	\$20.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.55	\$16.35	\$16.15
30" x 30" (Diamond Shape)	801-09	843	\$17.93	\$17.93	\$17.93	\$21.75	\$21.75	\$21.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.59	\$20.09	\$19.95
36" x 36" (Diamond Shape)	801-09	847	\$25.85	\$25.85	\$25.85	\$31.32	\$31.32	\$31.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.25	\$22.15	\$22.05
Days to deliver			30 DAYS			30 days												14-28 DAYS ARO		

BIDDERS NAME ADDRESS CONTACT PERSON TELEPHONE NO. FAX NUMBER EMAIL		VULCAN SIGNS 408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36536 J. TODD KONIAR 800-633-6845 251-943-1544 <a href="mailto:VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM">VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM</a>	OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. 11931 SR 93 N LOGAN, OH 43138 ROBBIE JENKS 800-523-8917 740-385-8016 <a href="mailto:ROBJ@OSBURNS.COM">ROBJ@OSBURNS.COM</a> ; <a href="mailto:SALES@OSBURNS.COM">SALES@OSBURNS.COM</a>	PATHMARK TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT, LLC 4435 HUNTER ROAD SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 RICK BRUSHABER 800-547-0874 512-392-2092 <a href="mailto:BIDS@PATHMARK.NET">BIDS@PATHMARK.NET</a>	SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC. 8341 EPICENTER BLVD. LAKE LAND, FL 33809 DAVID VESPA 863-984-1385 863-984-0058 <a href="mailto:DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM">DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM</a>	TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC. 3310-D FRICK RD. HOUSTON, TX 77086 RENEE CAMPBELL 281-448-7711 281-591-6827 <a href="mailto:RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM">RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM</a>	DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC 3809 S. 2ND ST. #D200 AUSTIN, TX 78704 VALERA BYRD 512-437-6499 512-361-0299 <a href="mailto:VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM">VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM</a>
3.0 CUSTOM FABRICATED SIGN	COUNTY ID #	PRICE PER EA	PRICE PER EA	PRICE PER EA	PRICE PER EA	PRICE PER EA	PRICE PER EA
DUNES ARE PROTECTED KEEP OUT NO GLASS CONTAINERS ALLOWED ON BEACH UP TO \$500 FINE	3325	\$24.57	\$20.82	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.50
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:		30	30				3-5 DAYS ARO

BIDDERS NAME ADDRESS CONTACT PERSON TELEPHONE NO. FAX NUMBER EMAIL	VULCAN SIGNS 408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36536 J. TODD KONIAR 800-633-6845 251-943-1544 <a href="mailto:VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM">VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM</a>	OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. 11931 SR 93 N LOGAN, OH 43138 ROBBIE JENKS 800-523-8917 740-385-8016 <a href="mailto:ROBJ@OSBURNS.COM">ROBJ@OSBURNS.COM</a> ; <a href="mailto:SALES@OSBURNS.COM">SALES@OSBURNS.COM</a>	PATHMARK TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT, LLC 4435 HUNTER ROAD SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 RICK BRUSHABER 800-547-0874 512-392-2092 <a href="mailto:BIDS@PATHMARK.NET">BIDS@PATHMARK.NET</a>	SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC. 8341 EPICENTER BLVD. LAKELAND, FL 33809 DAVID VESPA 863-984-1385 863-984-0058 <a href="mailto:DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM">DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM</a>	TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC. 3310-D FRICK RD. HOUSTON, TX 77086 RENEE CAMPBELL 281-448-7711 281-591-6827 <a href="mailto:RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM">RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM</a>	DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC 3809 S. 2ND ST. #D200 AUSTIN, TX 78704 VALERA BYRD 512-437-6499 512-361-0299 <a href="mailto:VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM">VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM</a>
---	--	--	---	--	---	---

**DELINEATORS**

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE: 550-41	ID #	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-50	51 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-50	51 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-50	51 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-50	51 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-50	51 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-50	51 +			
				PRICE EACH POST WHEN ORDERED IN				PRICE EACH POST WHEN ORDERED IN QTY'S AS SHOWN				PRICE EACH POST WHEN ORDERED IN QTY'S AS SHOWN				PRICE EACH POST WHEN ORDERED IN QTY'S AS SHOWN				PRICE EACH POST WHEN ORDERED IN QTY'S AS SHOWN			PRICE EACH POST WHEN ORDERED IN QTY'S AS SHOWN					
2 PART POXY FOR SURFACE MOUNT SHALL INCLUDE ONE (1) GALLON EPOXY AND ONE (1) GALLON CATALYST	3871			NO BID	NO BID			No Bid		Industrial Coating	-	\$119.00	\$99.00			No Bid	No Bid	Industrial Coatings	B-22	\$76.00	\$74.00			\$74.50	\$71.50			
CARSONITE POST, <b>FLAT</b> , DRIVABLE, <b>2 SIDED</b> DIAMOND GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, AMBER COLOR; <b>LENGTH 62"</b>	3854			NO BID	NO BID			No Bid				No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	Carsonite	RCM306201	\$24.35	\$23.50	NO BID						
CARSONITE POST, <b>CONCAVE</b> , DRIVABLE, <b>2 SIDED</b> DIAMOND GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, AMBER COLOR; <b>LENGTH 62"</b>	3856			NO BID	NO BID			No Bid				No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	Carsonite	CRM406201	\$25.25	\$24.50	NO BID						
STUB, ANCHOR FOR <b>CONCAVE</b> POST	3858			NO BID	NO BID			No Bid				No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	Carsonite	ANCBAR4	\$1.95	\$1.85	NO BID						
CARSONITE POST DRIVER	3858			NO BID				No Bid				No Bid				No Bid		Carsonite	RMTLPDR1	\$185.00	\$180.00			\$150.25				
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:												14 to 21 Days ARO									14-21 Days						7-10 DAYS ARO	

19-05 Road Safety Products - Signs and Posts - Fabricated Signs

BIDDERS NAME ADDRESS CONTACT PERSON TELEPHONE NO. FAX NUMBER EMAIL				VULCAN SIGNS 408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36536 J. TODD KONIAR 800-633-6845 251-943-1544 VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM				OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. 11931 SR 93 N LOGAN, OH 43138 ROBBIE JENKS 800-523-8917 740-385-8016 ROB@OSBURNS.COM SALES@OSBURNS.COM				PATHMARK TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT, LLC 4435 HUNTER ROAD SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 RICK BRUSHABER 800-547-0874 512-392-2092 BIDS@PATHMARK.NET				SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC. 8341 EPICENTER BLVD. LAKELAND, FL 33809 DAVID VESPA 863-984-1385 863-984-0058 DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM				TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC. 3310-D FRICK RD. HOUSTON, TX 77086 RENEE CAMPBELL 281-448-7711 281-591-6827 RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM				DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC 3809 S. 2ND ST. #D200 AUSTIN, TX 78704 VALERA BYRD 512-437-6499 512-361-0299 VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM			
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE				3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN MFR:		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN MFR:		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN MFR:		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN MFR:		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN MFR:		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN MFR:	
ITEM NO.	Size / Description	TX DOT #	COUNTY ID# DG	1-50	51+	1-50	51+	1-50	51+	1-50	51+	1-50	51+	1-50	51+	1-50	51+	1-50	51+	1-50	51+	1-50	51+	1-50	51+	1-50	51+
1	12 X 36 Bridge Marker R	OM-3R	7213	\$18.91	\$18.91	\$18.91	\$18.91	\$20.82	\$20.82			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$28.00	\$26.00	
2	12 X 36 Bridge Marker L	OM-3L	7215	\$18.91	\$18.91	\$18.91	\$18.91	\$20.82	\$20.82			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$28.00	\$26.00	
3	18 X 18 Advisory Speed Plate (Blank) MPH	W13-1P	4479	\$15.14	\$15.14	\$15.14	\$15.14	\$15.63	\$15.63			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$20.00	\$19.25	
4	18 X 18 Brazoria County Road Number Green / White		4481	\$18.86	\$18.86	\$18.86	\$18.86	\$15.63	\$15.63			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$20.00	\$19.25	
5	24 X 18 County Maintenance Begins		4487	\$24.57	\$24.57	\$24.57	\$24.57	\$20.82	\$20.82			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$27.00	\$26.00	
6	24 X 18 County Maintenance Ends		4488	\$24.57	\$24.57	\$24.57	\$24.57	\$20.82	\$20.82			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$27.00	\$26.00	
8	24 X 18 Cell Phone Use Prohibited	S7-1T		\$24.57	\$24.57	\$24.57	\$24.57	\$20.82	\$20.82			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$27.00	\$26.00	
9	24 X 30 Speed Limit (Blank) MPH	R2-1	4498	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$34.70	\$34.70			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$44.00	\$42.00	
10	24 X 30 Speed Limit (with Numbers) MPH	R2-1-XX	4499	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$34.70	\$34.70			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$44.00	\$42.00	
12	24 X 30 No Parking	R8-3a	4502	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$34.70	\$34.70			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$44.00	\$42.00	
13	24 X 30 Weight Limit (Blank) Tons	R12-1	4503	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$34.70	\$34.70			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$44.00	\$42.00	
14	24 X 30 Weight Limit (with Numbers) Tons	W12-1	4504	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$34.70	\$34.70			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$44.00	\$42.00	
15	24 X 30 No Dumping Allowed	R19-5T	4505	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$34.70	\$34.70			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$44.00	\$42.00	
16	24 X 30 Do Not Pass	R4-1	4506	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$34.70	\$34.70			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$44.00	\$42.00	
17	24 X 30 Chevron Alignment	W1-8R		\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$31.51	\$34.70	\$34.70			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$44.00	\$42.00	
19	24 X 30 No Thru Trucks	R10-9A		\$31.96	\$31.96	\$31.96	\$31.96	\$34.70	\$34.70			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$44.00	\$42.00	
20	24 X 36 Weight Limit - Axle or Tandem (Blank) LBS	R12-4 or R12-5	4507	\$37.79	\$37.79	\$37.79	\$37.79	\$41.64	\$41.64			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$54.00	\$52.50	
21	24 X 36 Weight Limit - Tandem Axle (Blank) LBS	R12-4 or R12-5	4508	\$37.79	\$37.79	\$37.79	\$37.79	\$41.64	\$41.64			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$54.00	\$52.50	
22	30 STOP	R1-1	4509	\$38.08	\$38.08	\$38.08	\$38.08	\$43.37	\$43.37			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$58.00	\$55.00	
23	30" Hinged Sign Yellow with Black Message - Water Over Road / Drive Friendly		7219	\$88.16	\$88.16	\$88.16	\$88.16	\$63.38	\$63.38			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$64.00	\$60.00	
24	30 X 24 Detour (Florescent Orange)	M4-9R or M4-9L	4510	\$32.19	\$32.19	\$32.19	\$32.19	\$34.70	\$34.70			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$44.00	\$42.00	
25	30 X 30 Right - Left Turn	W-1-1R(L)	4511	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$43.38	\$43.38			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$56.00	\$52.00	
26	30 X 30 Right - Left Curve (Yellow)	W1-2R(L)	4512	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$43.38	\$43.38			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$56.00	\$52.00	
27	30 X 30 Right - Left Reverse Turn (Yellow)	W1-3R(L)	4513	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$43.38	\$43.38			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$56.00	\$52.00	
28	30 X 30 Right - Left Reverse Curve (Yellow)	W1-4R(L)	4514	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$43.38	\$43.38			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$56.00	\$52.00	
29	30 X 30 Right - Left Winding Road (Yellow)	W1-5R(L)	4515	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$43.38	\$43.38			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$56.00	\$52.00	
30	30 X 30 Cross Road	W2-1	4516	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$43.38	\$43.38			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$56.00	\$52.00	
31	30 X 30 Side Road	W2-2R(L)	4517	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$43.38	\$43.38			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$56.00	\$52.00	
32	30 X 30 T Symbol	W2-4	4518	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$43.38	\$43.38			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$56.00	\$52.00	
33	30 X 30 Y Symbol	W2-5	4519	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$39.36	\$43.38	\$43.38			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	\$56.00	\$52.00	



BIDDERS NAME ADDRESS CONTACT PERSON TELEPHONE NO. FAX NUMBER EMAIL		VULCAN SIGNS 408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36536 J. TODD KONIAR 800-633-6845 251-943-1544 VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM				OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. 11931 SR 93 N LOGAN, OH 43138 ROBBIE JENKS 800-523-8917 740-385-8016 ROBJ@OSBURNS.COM, SALES@OSBURNS.COM				PATHMARK TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT, LLC 4435 HUNTER ROAD SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 RICK BRUSHABER 800-547-0874 512-392-2092 BIDS@PATHMARK.NET				SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC. 8341 EPICENTER BLVD. LAKELAND, FL 33809 DAVID VESPA 863-984-1385 863-984-0058 DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM				TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC. 3310-D FRICK RD. HOUSTON, TX 77086 RENEE CAMPBELL 281-448-7711 281-591-6827 RENEE@TRANTEXING.COM				DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC 3809 S. 2ND ST. #D200 AUSTIN, TX 78704 VALERA BYRD 512-437-6499 512-361-0299 VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM				
6.1 RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS COMM CODE: 550-30	COUNTY ID #	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	Price Per UOM	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG
TYPE I-C (SINGLE REFLECTIVE FACE, WHITE)	917			NO BID					No Bid	Apex	921	50	\$59.00			No Bid	No Bid	Ray-O-Lite	1-C	1 Box	50/Box	\$ 52.00	RAYOLITE		1	0.84
TYPE II-A-A (TWO REFLECTIVE FACES, BOTH AMBER)	918			NO BID					No Bid	Apex	921	50	\$59.00			No Bid	No Bid	Ray-O-Lite	II-A-A	1 Box	50/Box	\$ 52.00	RAYOLITE		1	0.84
TYPE II-C-R (TWO REFLECTIVE FACES, WHITE APPROACHING, RED TRAILING)	919			NO BID					No Bid	Apex	921	50	\$59.00			No Bid	No Bid	Ray-O-Lite	II-C-R	1 Box	50/Box	\$ 52.00	RAYOLITE		1	0.84
TYPE II-C-C (TWO REFLECTIVE FACES, BOTH WHITE)	3310			NO BID					No Bid	Apex	921	50	\$59.00			No Bid	No Bid	Ray-O-Lite	II-C-C	1 Box	50/Box	\$ 55.00	RAYOLITE		1	0.84
TYPE II-BLUE				NO BID					No Bid	Apex	921	50	\$59.00			No Bid	No Bid	Ray-O-Lite	II-B-B	1 Box	50/Box	\$ 72.00	RAYOLITE		1	0.91
EXPOXY (TUBE TYPE)FOR RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER		NO BID				no bid				Aexcel		12	\$390.00	No Bid				Aexcel	600CCEpoxy	Case	12/Case	\$ 270.00	PART A AND B TUBE SET \$18.00/ EACH			
EXPOXY GUN		NO BID								DTC		1	\$155.00	No Bid				Trantex	600CC Epoxy Gun	Each	1	\$ 157.50	\$215.00 EACH			
SELF ADHESIVE - TYPE I-C (SINGLE REFLECTIVE FACE, WHITE)				NO BID					No Bid	3M	PSA	100	\$385.00			No Bid	No Bid	3M	ICSA	1 Box	100/Box	\$ 275.00	NO BID			
SELF ADHESIVE - TYPE II-A-A (TWO REFLECTIVE FACES, BOTH AMBER)				NO BID					No Bid	3M	PSA	100	\$385.00			No Bid	No Bid	3M	IIASA	1 Box	100/Box	\$ 280.00	NO BID			
SELF ADHESIVE -TYPE II-C-R (TWO REFLECTIVE FACES; WHITE APPROACHING, RED TRAILING)				NO BID					No Bid	3M	PSA	100	\$385.00			No Bid	No Bid	3M	IICRSA	1 Box	100/Box	\$ 280.00	NO BID			
SELF ADHESIVE -TYPE II-C-C (TWO REFLECTIVE FACES; BOTH WHITE)				NO BID					No Bid	3M	PSA	100	\$385.00			No Bid	No Bid	3M	IICCSA	1 Box	100/Box	\$ 280.00	NO BID			
SELF ADHESIVE - TYPE II-BLUE				NO BID					No Bid	3M	PSA	100	\$385.00			No Bid	No Bid	3M	IIBBSA	1 Box	100/Box	\$ 345.00	NO BID			
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:		NO BID								21 to 30 Days ARO								10-14 Days				10-14 DAYS ARO				

BIDDERS NAME ADDRESS CONTACT PERSON TELEPHONE NO. FAX NUMBER EMAIL		VULCAN SIGNS 408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36536 J. TODD KONIAR 800-633-6845 251-943-1544 VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM				OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. 11931 SR 93 N LOGAN, OH 43138 ROBBIE JENKS 800-523-8917 740-385-8016 ROBJ@OSBURNS.COM; SALES@OSBURNS.COM				PATHMARK TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT, LLC 4435 HUNTER ROAD SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 RICK BRUSHABER 800-547-0874 512-392-2092 BIDS@PATHMARK.NET				SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC. 8341 EPICENTER BLVD. LAKELAND, FL 33809 DAVID VESPA 863-984-1385 863-984-0058 DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM				TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC. 3310-D FRICK RD. HOUSTON, TX 77086 RENEE CAMPBELL 281-448-7711 281-591-6827 RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM				DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC 3809 S. 2ND ST. #D200 AUSTIN, TX 78704 VALERA BYRD 512-437-6499 512-361-0299 VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM				
Roll Up Construction Signs & Stands																										
Description	TX MUTCD #	Item ID#	MFG Name	MFG#	1-9	10+	MFG Name	MFG#	1-9	10+	MFG Name	MFG#	1-9	10+	MFG Name	MFG#	1-9	10+	MFG Name	MFG#	1-9	10+	MFG Name	MFG#	1-9	10+
36" X 36" ROADWORK AHEAD	CW20-1D				NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3000X-36	\$210.90	\$210.90	Safety Products	RV-RWA-36R	\$79.00	\$75.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS36RWA	\$29.95	\$29.50	Dicke	Dicke	\$36.50	\$35.50	BONE		\$78.00	\$75.00
36" X 36" WORKERS AHEAD	CS21-1bT				NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3000X-36	\$210.90	\$210.90	Safety Products	RV-WA-36R	\$79.00	\$75.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS36WA	\$29.95	\$29.50	Dicke	Dicke	\$36.50	\$35.50	BONE		\$78.00	\$75.00
36" X 36" ROADWORK 5 MPH					NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3000X-36	\$210.90	\$210.90	Safety Products	RV-CUSTOM-36R	\$79.00	\$75.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS36RW5MPH	\$29.95	\$29.50	Dicke	Dicke	\$36.50	\$35.50	BONE		\$78.00	\$75.00
36" X 36" FLAGGER AHEAD					NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3000X-36	\$210.90	\$210.90	Safety Products	RV-FA-36R	\$79.00	\$75.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS36FA	\$29.95	\$29.50	Dicke	Dicke	\$36.50	\$35.50	BONE		\$78.00	\$75.00
36" X 36" LOOSE GRAVEL					NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3000X-36	\$210.90	\$210.90	Safety Products	RV-LG-36R	\$79.00	\$75.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS36LG	\$29.95	\$29.50	Dicke	Dicke	\$36.50	\$35.50	BONE		\$78.00	\$75.00
36" X 36" ONE LANE AHEAD					NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3000X-36	\$210.90	\$210.90	Safety Products	RV-OLRA-36R	\$79.00	\$75.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS36OLA	\$29.95	\$29.50	Dicke	Dicke	\$36.50	\$35.50	BONE		\$78.00	\$75.00
36" X 36" CUSTOM SIGN					NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3000X-36	\$260.90	\$260.90	Safety Products	RV-CUSTOM-36R	\$79.00	\$75.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS36CUSTOM	\$42.50	\$40.95	Dicke	Dicke	\$54.50	\$49.50	BONE		\$78.00	\$75.00
48" X 48" ROADWORK AHEAD	W20-1D				NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3003X-48	\$250.04	\$250.04	Safety Products	RV-RWA-48R	\$109.00	\$99.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS48RWA	\$36.75	\$35.00	Dicke	Dicke	\$45.00	\$44.00	BONE		\$91.00	\$89.00
48" X 48" WORKERS AHEAD	CW21-1aT CW21-1bT				NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3003X-48	\$250.04	\$250.04	Safety Products	RV-WA-48R	\$109.00	\$99.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS48WA	\$36.75	\$35.00	Dicke	Dicke	\$45.00	\$44.00	BONE		\$91.00	\$89.00
48" X 48" ROADWORK 5 MPH					NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3003X-48	\$250.04	\$250.04	Safety Products	RV-CUSTOM-48R	\$109.00	\$99.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS48RW5MPH	\$36.75	\$35.00	Dicke	Dicke	\$45.00	\$44.00	BONE		\$91.00	\$89.00
48" X 48" FLAGGER AHEAD	CW20-7 CW20-7aD				NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3003X-48	\$250.04	\$250.04	Safety Products	RV-FA-48R	\$109.00	\$99.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS48FA	\$36.75	\$35.00	Dicke	Dicke	\$45.00	\$44.00	BONE		\$91.00	\$89.00
48" X 48" LOOSE GRAVEL	CW8-7				NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3003X-48	\$250.04	\$250.04	Safety Products	RV-LG-48R	\$109.00	\$99.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS48LG	\$36.75	\$35.00	Dicke	Dicke	\$45.00	\$44.00	BONE		\$91.00	\$89.00
48" X 48" MERGE (with Velcro-Interchangeable Left or Right)	CW8-2TL(R)				NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3003X-48	\$260.04	\$260.04	Safety Products	RV-CUSTOM-48R	\$129.00	\$129.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS48MRS-OL	\$45.40	\$44.95	Dicke	Dicke	\$54.00	\$53.00	BONE		\$111.00	\$109.00
48" X 48" ONE LANE AHEAD					NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3003X-48	\$250.04	\$250.04	Safety Products	RV-OLRA-48R	\$109.00	\$99.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS48OLA	\$36.75	\$35.00	Dicke	Dicke	\$45.00	\$44.00	BONE		\$91.00	\$89.00
48" X 48" CUSTOM SIGN					NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3003X-48	\$300.04	\$300.04	Safety Products	RV-CUSTOM-48R	\$109.00	\$99.00	Safety Zone Specialists	1MS48CUSTOM	\$48.20	\$47.10	Dicke	Dicke	\$67.00	\$62.00	BONE		\$91.00	\$89.00
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:							14-21				14 TO 21 Days ARO				7-10 Days				10-14 Days				7-10 DAYS ARO			

19-05 Road Safety Products - Signs and Posts - Roll Up Sign Stand

BIDDERS NAME ADDRESS CONTACT PERSON TELEPHONE NO. FAX NUMBER EMAIL				VULCAN SIGNS 408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36536 J. TODD KONIAR 800-633-6845 251-943-1544 <a href="mailto:VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM">VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM</a>				OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. 11931 SR 93 N LOGAN, OH 43138 ROBBIE JENKS 800-523-8917 740-385-8016 <a href="mailto:J@OSBURNS.COM">J@OSBURNS.COM</a> ; <a href="mailto:SALES@OSBURNS.COM">SALES@OSBURNS.COM</a>				PATHMARK TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT, LLC 4435 HUNTER ROAD SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 RICK BRUSHABER 800-547-0874 512-392-2092 <a href="mailto:BIDS@PATHMARK.NET">BIDS@PATHMARK.NET</a>				SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC. 8341 EPICENTER BLVD. LAKELAND, FL 33809 DAVID VESPA 863-984-1385 863-984-0058 <a href="mailto:DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM">DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM</a>				TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC. 3310-D FRICK RD. HOUSTON, TX 77086 RENEE CAMPBELL 281-448-7711 281-591-6827 <a href="mailto:RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM">RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM</a>				DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC 3809 S. 2ND ST. #D200 AUSTIN, TX 78704 VALERA BYRD 512-437-6499 512-361-0299 <a href="mailto:VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM">VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM</a>				
ROLL UP SIGN STAND																												
DESCRIPTION	COMM CODE	TXMUTCD #	ITEM ID#	MFG NAME	MFG#	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG#	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG#	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG#	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG#	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG#	1-9	10+	
36" X 36" RIBS FOR SIGN	801-60		3654			NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	RR200-36	\$9.58	\$9.58	Safety Products		-	\$19.00	\$19.00	Safety Zone Specialists	RIBS36	\$9.10	\$8.80	Trantex	N/A	\$10.75	\$10.75	BONE		\$6.75	\$6.50
48" X 48" STAND	801-60		3655			NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	DF3003W	\$124.05	\$124.05	Traffix Devices	Little Buster	\$179.00	\$159.00	Dicke Tool	SDL1000W	\$91.00	\$90.50	Trantex	N/A	\$92.50	\$92.50	BONE	LITTLE BUSTER SIGN	\$125.00	\$119.00	
48" X 48" RIBS FOR SIGN	801-60		3656			NO BID	NO BID	Dicke	RR100-48	\$13.12	\$13.12	Safety Products		-	\$21.00	\$21.00	Safety Zone Specialists	RIBS48	\$11.80	\$11.40	Trantex	N/A	\$13.75	\$13.75	BONE		\$9.95	\$9.50
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:								14-21				10 to 14 Days ARO				7-10 Days				7-10 Days				7-10 DAYS ARO				



BIDDERS NAME				ADDRESS				CONTACT PERSON				TELEPHONE NO.				FAX NUMBER				EMAIL								
VULCAN SIGNS				408 EAST BERRY AVENUE				J. TODD KONIAR				800-633-6845				251-943-1544				<a href="mailto:VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM">VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM</a>								
OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.				11931 SR 93 N LOGAN, OH 43138				ROBBIE JENKS				800-523-8917				740-385-8016				<a href="mailto:ROBJ@OSBURNS.COM">ROBJ@OSBURNS.COM</a> ; <a href="mailto:SALES@OSBURNS.COM">SALES@OSBURNS.COM</a>								
PATHMARK TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT, LLC				4435 HUNTER ROAD SAN MARCOS, TX 78666				RICK BRUSHABER				800-547-0874				512-392-2092				<a href="mailto:BIDS@PATHMARK.NET">BIDS@PATHMARK.NET</a>								
SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.				8341 EPICENTER BLVD. LAKE LAND, FL 33809				DAVID VESPA				863-984-1385				863-984-0058				<a href="mailto:DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM">DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM</a>								
RANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.				3310-D FRICK RD. HOUSTON, TX 77086				RENEE CAMPBELL				281-448-7711				281-591-6827				<a href="mailto:RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM">RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM</a>								
DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC				3809 S. 2ND ST. #D200 AUSTIN, TX 78704				VALERA BYRD				512-437-6499				512-361-0299				<a href="mailto:VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM">VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM</a>								
RUMBLE STRIPS				COMM CODE	COUNTY ID #	COLOR	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER ROLL		MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER ROLL		MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER ROLL		MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER ROLL		MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER ROLL			
RUMBLE STRIPS				550-79	3352	WHITE			1 - 25	25 +			1 - 25	25 +			1 - 25	25 +			1 - 25	25 +			1 - 25	25 +		
									NO BID				No Bid				No Bid	No Bid			Swarco	4423 White	\$275.00	\$260.00			No Bid	No Bid
Days to delivery ARO:								NO BID												21 Days								
Alternate length roll:																				36FT per pack								

BIDDERS NAME			VULCAN SIGNS					OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.					PATHMARK TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT, LLC					SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.					TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.					DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC										
ADDRESS			408 EAST BERRY AVENUE					11931 SR 93 N LOGAN, OH 43138					4435 HUNTER ROAD SAN MARCOS, TX 78666					8341 EPICENTER BLVD. LAKELAND, FL 33809					3310-D FRICK RD. HOUSTON, TX 77096					3809 S. 2ND ST. #D200 AUSTIN, TX 78704										
CONTACT PERSON			J. TODD KONIAR					ROBBIE JENKS					RICK BRUSHASER					DAVID VESPA					RENEE CAMPBELL					VALERA BYRD										
TELEPHONE NO.			800-633-6845					800-523-8917					800-547-0874					863-984-1385					281-448-7711					512-437-6499										
FAX NUMBER			251-943-1544					740-385-8016					512-392-2092					863-984-0058					281-591-6827					512-361-0299										
EMAIL			<a href="mailto:VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM">VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM</a>					ROBJ@OSBURNS.COM; SALES@OSBURNS.COM					<a href="mailto:BIDS@PATHMARK.NET">BIDS@PATHMARK.NET</a>					<a href="mailto:DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM">DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM</a>					<a href="mailto:RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM">RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM</a>					<a href="mailto:VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM">VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM</a>										
SIGN CAPS AND CROSS BLADES	COMM CODE	COUNTY ID #	MFG #	PRICE 1-9	PRICE 10 +	PRICE PER BOX	QTY IN BOX	ALTERNATE QTY IN BOX	MFG #	PRICE 1-9	PRICE 10 +	PRICE PER BOX	QTY IN BOX	ALTERNATE QTY IN BOX	MFG #	PRICE 1-9	PRICE 10 +	PRICE PER BOX	QTY IN BOX	ALTERNATE QTY IN BOX	MFG #	PRICE 1-9	PRICE 10 +	PRICE PER BOX	QTY IN BOX	ALTERNATE QTY IN BOX	MFG #	PRICE 1-9	PRICE 10 +	PRICE PER BOX	QTY IN BOX	ALTERNATE QTY IN BOX	MFG #	PRICE 1-9	PRICE 10 +	PRICE PER BOX	QTY IN BOX	ALTERNATE QTY IN BOX
SIGN, CAP, 2-3/8" ROUND, FLAT	801-12	2041	MD SOLUTIONS	\$4.76	\$4.76	\$238.50	50		BA812	\$8.95	\$8.95		1		120RCF238	No Bid	No Bid	\$198.75	25	N/A		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			512RCF238	\$3.60	\$3.50	\$170.00	50	N/A	MD SOLUTIONS	\$4.00	\$3.75	\$375.00	100	
SIGN, MOUNTING BRACKET SET, 2-3/8", Z238	801-12	2045	MD SOLUTIONS	\$2.95	\$2.95	\$73.75	25			\$8.95	\$8.95		1		Grip-Tite	No Bid	No Bid	\$150.00	100	N/A		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			UBCLAMP238	4.35/set	4.25/set	\$207.50	50	N/A	GRIP TITE	\$3.05	\$2.95	\$300.00	100 SETS	
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 90 DEGREE FLAT	801-12	2046	MD SOLUTIONS	\$4.62	\$4.62	\$231.00	50		BA90F12	\$8.95	\$8.95		1		120VCF090	No Bid	No Bid	\$198.75	25	N/A		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			512UCF090	\$3.60	\$3.50	\$170.00	50	N/A	MD SOLUTIONS	\$6.25	\$6.00	\$600.00	100	
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 180 DEGREE, FLAT	801-12	2048	MD SOLUTIONS	\$4.62	\$4.62	\$231.00	50		BA180F12	\$8.95	\$8.95		1		120VCF180	No Bid	No Bid	\$198.75	25	N/A		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			512UCF180	\$3.60	\$3.50	\$170.00	50	N/A	MD SOLUTIONS	\$6.50	\$6.15	\$615.00	100	
SIGN, BLADE, CROSSPIECE, FLAT	801-12	2050	MD SOLUTIONS	\$4.79	\$4.79	\$239.50	50		BA8A12	\$8.95	\$8.95		1		120CPF090	No Bid	No Bid	\$198.75	25	N/A		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			512CPF090	\$3.60	\$3.50	\$170.00	50	N/A	MD SOLUTIONS	\$4.00	\$3.75	\$375.00	100	
BRACKET, Z238 ALUMINUM INTER LOCK	8010-12	6658	VULCAN SIGNS	\$1.75	\$1.75	\$87.50	50		PPB-13	\$8.95	\$8.95		1		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NA	N/A		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			SSCLAMP238	\$2.75	\$2.65	\$127.50	50	N/A	NO BID					
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:			30 DAYS					10-14 Days					14 to 21 Days ARO					14-21 Days					7-10 DAYS ARO															

BIDDERS NAME				VULCAN SIGNS				OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.				PATHMARK TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT, LLC				SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.				TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.				DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC														
ADDRESS				408 EAST BERRY AVENUE				11931 SR 93 N				4435 HUNTER ROAD				8341 EPICENTER BLVD.				3310-D FRICK RD.				3809 S. 2ND ST. #D200														
CONTACT PERSON				FOLEY, AL 38338				LOGAN, OH 43138				SAN MARCOS, TX 78666				LAKELAND, FL 33809				HOUSTON, TX 77066				AUSTIN, TX 78704														
TELEPHONE NO.				J. TODD KONIAR				ROBBIE JENKS				RICK BRUSHABER				DAVID VESPA				RENEE CAMPBELL				VALERA BYRD														
FAX NUMBER				800-833-8845				800-523-8917				800-547-0874				863-984-1385				281-448-7711				512-437-6499														
EMAIL				VULCANSI@VULCANINC.COM				740-385-8016				512-392-2092				863-984-0058				281-591-6827				512-361-0299														
SIGN POSTS				VULCAN SIGNS				OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.				PATHMARK TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT, LLC				SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.				TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.				DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC														
COMM CODE	COUNTY ID #	LENGTH	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE						
	801-30	894	12'	TRINITY		\$24.81	\$917.97	37							Allied	-	No Bid	\$923.15	37	N/A							Trinity	23/8(16G)12'Galv.A-15	\$28.95	\$1,071.15	37	N/A	ALLIED		\$21.05	\$778.85	37	
	801-30	901	10'	NUCOR		\$20.46	\$1,023.00	50							Grimco	-	No Bid	\$1,795.00	50	N/A							Chicago Heights	10'-2#GU	\$27.50	\$1,375.00	50	N/A	GRIMCO		\$17.25	\$431.25	25	
	801-30	902	12'	NUCOR		\$24.55	\$1,227.50	50							Grimco	-	No Bid	\$2,047.50	50	N/A						Chicago Heights	12'-2#GU	\$33.00	\$1,650.00	50	N/A	GRIMCO		\$26.25	\$656.25	25		
	801-30	1045		TRANTEX		\$17.64	\$882.00	50							Allied	-	No Bid	\$555.00	37	N/A						Trinity	PL Socket	\$23.50	\$869.50	37	N/A	ALLIED		\$11.05	\$408.85	37		
	801-30	3850		TRANTEX		\$2.75	\$137.50	50							Allied	-	No Bid	\$160.00	37	N/A						Trinity	PL Wedge	\$4.75	\$175.75	37	N/A	ALLIED		\$3.05	\$112.85	37		
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:				30 DAYS								30 to 45 Days ARO								14-21 Days				10-14 DAYS ARO														

BIDDERS NAME				VULCAN SIGNS				OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.				PATHMARK TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT, LLC				SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.				TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.				DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC			
ADDRESS				408 EAST BERRY AVENUE				11931 SR 93 N LOGAN, OH 43138				4435 HUNTER ROAD SAN MARCOS, TX 78666				8341 EPICENTER BLVD. LAKE LAND, FL 33809				3310-D FRICK RD. HOUSTON, TX 77086				3809 S. 2ND ST. #D200 AUSTIN, TX 78704			
CONTACT PERSON				FOLEY, AL 36536				ROBBIE JENKS				RICK BRUSHABER				DAVID VESPA				RENEE CAMPBELL							
TELEPHONE NO				800-433-6845				800-523-8917				800-547-0874				863-984-1385				281-448-7711							
FAX NUMBER				251-943-1544				740-385-8016				512-392-2092				863-984-0058				281-591-6827							
EMAIL				<a href="mailto:VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM">VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM</a>				<a href="mailto:ROBJ@OSBURNS.COM">ROBJ@OSBURNS.COM</a> ; <a href="mailto:SALES@OSBURNS.COM">SALES@OSBURNS.COM</a>				<a href="mailto:BIDS@PATHMARK.NET">BIDS@PATHMARK.NET</a>				<a href="mailto:DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM">DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM</a>				<a href="mailto:RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM">RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM</a>				<a href="mailto:VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM">VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM</a>			
SLOW MOVING VEHICLE				PRICE PER UOM				PRICE PER UOM				PRICE PER UOM				PRICE PER UOM				PRICE PER UOM							
COMM CODE	COUT	COLOR		MFG NAME	MFG #	1 - 9	10 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	1 - 9	10 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	1 - 9	10 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	1 - 9	10 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	1 - 9	10 +				
SIGN WITH MOUNTING BRACKET, 16" X 14"	801-83	2567	RED / ORANGE			NO BID	NO BID			No Bid				No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid				
SIGN ONLY, 16" X 14"	8010-83	3306	RED / ORANGE			NO BID	NO BID	Osburn	Osburn	\$10.80	\$10.80			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid				
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:					NO BID				30 Days																		

BIDDERS NAME		VULCAN SIGNS		OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.		PATHMARK TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT, LLC		SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.		TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.		DOBIE SUPPLY, LLC																												
ADDRESS		408 EAST BERRY AVENUE		11931 SR 93 N		4435 HUNTER ROAD		8341 EPICENTER BLVD.		3310-D FRICK RD.		3809 S. 2ND ST. #D200																												
CONTACT PERSON		J. TODD KONIAR		ROBBIE JENKS		RICK BRUSHABER		DAVID VESPA		RENEE CAMPBELL		VALERA BYRD																												
TELEPHONE NO.		800-633-6845		800-523-8917		800-547-0874		863-984-1385		281-448-7711		512-437-6499																												
FAX NUMBER		251-943-1544		740-385-8016		512-392-2092		863-984-0058		281-591-8827		512-361-0299																												
EMAIL		VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM		ROBJ@OSBURNS.COM; SALES@OSBURNS.COM		BIDS@PATHMARK.NET		DAVID@SAFETYZONESPECIALISTS.COM		RENEE@TRANTEXINC.COM		VAL@DOBIESUPPLY.COM																												
<b>MARKERS - TEMPORARY AND END OF ROAD</b>																																								
TEMPORARY MARKERS		COMM CODE	COUNTY ID #	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10 +							
TEMPORARY MARKER, POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: <b>YELLOW #932-2Y</b>		550-34	6329						NO BID					No Bid		Pexco/Davidson	TRPM	Box	500	\$250.00	\$245.00						No Bid	No Bid	Pexco	TRPM-2Y	1 Box	500/Box	\$240.00	\$230.00	PEXCO		1		\$0.46	\$0.45
TEMPORARY MARKER, POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: <b>WHITE #932-2W</b>		550-34	7036						NO BID					No Bid		Pexco/Davidson	TRPM	Box	500	\$250.00	\$245.00						No Bid	No Bid	Pexco	TRPM-2W	1 Box	500/Box	\$250.00	\$240.00	PEXCO		1		\$0.46	\$0.45
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:				NO BID								14 to 21 Days ARO				14 to 21 Days ARO				14-21 Days				7-10 DAYS ARO																
END OF ROAD MARKER		COMM CODE	COUNTY ID#	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10 +	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10 +							
RED ON RED 9, BUTTON, 18 X 18		801-83	3299	VULCAN SIGNS				\$21.97	\$21.97	Osburn	Osburn			\$30.62	\$30.62	PathMark	OM-3R				\$49.00	\$35.00					No Bid	No Bid	Trantex	18x18RR EOREG			\$62.50	\$59.75	Trantex	18x18RR EOREG			\$28.50	\$28.00
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:				30 DAYS				30 DAYS				10 to 14 Days ARO				14-21 Days				5-7 DAYS ARO																				