

19-08 FLASHERS, STROBES & WARNING LIGHTS				SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS INC 8341 EPICENTER BLVD LAKELAND, FL 33809 863-984-1385 863-984-0058 david@safetyzonespecialists.com					TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS INC 3310-D FRICK RD HOUSTON, TX 77086 281-448-7711 281-591-6827 rene@trantexinc.com					DOBIE SUPPLY LLC 601 COMMERCIAL BUDA, TX 78133 512-437-6499 512-361-0299 val@dobiesupply.com				
FLASHER LIGHT BARRICADE	COMM CODE	COUNTY ID #		MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER EACH	PRICE PER CTN	QTY PER CTN	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER EACH	PRICE PER CTN	QTY PER CTN	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER EACH	PRICE PER CTN	QTY PER CTN
FLASHER LIGHT TO INCLUDE ALL HARDWARE, BOLT, WRENCH, TAMPER RESISTANT HARDWARE	550-96	3691		Empco	ECONO	\$15.50	\$155.00	10	Trantex	LED	\$18.25	\$179.50	10	CHECKERS IND		\$13.80		10
BATTERY 12 VOLT	550-96	7205				No Bid	No Bid				No Bid			NO BID				
BATTERY 6 VOLT, TYPE HEAVY DUTY, SPRINGTOP, RAILROAD LANTERNS	550-96	7206		Rayovac	944C	\$3.70	\$14.80	4			No Bid			NO BID				
BATTERY, 6 VOLT, TYPE GENERAL PURPOSE, SPRING TOP	550-96	7207		Rayovac	944C	\$3.70	\$14.80	4	Trantex	6V	\$3.60	\$36.00	10	NO BID				
REPLACEMENT BULB	550-96	3692		Empco	1850	\$2.50	\$250.00	100	Trantex		\$3.75	\$37.50	10	CHECKERS IND		\$6.85		1
ALTERNATE: 6V, LED, SPRING TERMINAL BATTERY FOR REPLACEMENT				Empco	99-20410L	\$21.10	\$211.00	10	No Bid					NO BID				
LIGHT, 6 VOLT, ABLE TO FLASH DAY AND NIGHT, LED BULB				Empco	212-6	\$78.20	\$391.00	5						NO BID				
DELIVERY	7-10 Days								10 days					10-14 DAYS ARO				
QUAD FLASH STROBE- LED	COMM CODE	COUNTY ID #	COLOR	MFG #		PRICE PER EACH			MFG #		PRICE PER EACH			MFG #		PRICE PER EACH		
QUAD FLASH STROBE, MAGNET MOUNT	055-57	3716	AMBER	Star	256TCLMA	\$87.50			Federal Signal	220260-02	\$80.75					\$70.75		
QUAD FLASH STROBE, PERMANENT MOUNT	055-57	3717	AMBER	Star	256TCLA	\$74.50			Federal Signal	220250-02	\$71.50					\$54.00		
BULB REPLACEMENT	055-57	3718	N/A			No Bid					No Bid					\$27.00		
QUAD FLASH STROBE, MAGNET MOUNT WITH WIRE GUARD	055-57	3719	AMBER	Star	274-SSTCM	\$135.20			Federal Signal	220260-02WWH	\$112.50					\$83.70		
QUAD FLASH STROBE, PERMANENT MOUNT WITH WIRE GUARD	055-57	3720	AMBER	Star	274-SSTCM	\$125.60			Federal Signal	220250-02WWH	\$103.25					\$67.50		
BULB REPLACEMENT	055-57	3721	N/A			No Bid					No Bid					\$27.00		
DELIVERY	10-14 Days								21-30 Days					7-10 DAYS ARO				
TRAFFIC ADVISOR DIRECTIONAL LIGHT BAR - LED	COMM CODE	COUNTY ID #	COLOR	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER EACH			MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER EACH			MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER EACH		
DIRECTIONAL LIGHT BAR	055-57	9123	AMBER	Ecco	9410A	\$340.20			Federal Signal	SL6SA	\$410.50			SOUND OFF	LUS 2 MODUL	\$185.00		
REPLACEMENT BULB	055-57	9143	N/A			No Bid					No Bid			NO BID				
DELIVERY	10-14 DAYS ARO																	
MINI LIGHT BAR	COMM CODE	COUNTY ID #	COLOR	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER EACH			MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER EACH			MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER EACH		
MINI LIGHT BAR, PERMANENT MOUNT	055-57	PENDING	BLUE/AMBER	Ecco	5585CAB	\$184.10			Federal Signal	454301H-abs	\$285.00			PINNACLE		\$251.25		
MINI LIGHT BAR, MAGNETIC MOUNT WITH CIGARETTE LIGHTER PLUG	055-57	PENDING	BLUE/AMBER	Ecco	5585CAB-MG	\$218.55			Federal Signal	454302H-abs	\$295.00			PINNACLE		\$251.25		
REPLACEMENT BULBS	055-57	3724	N/A			No Bid					No Bid			NO BID		NO BID		
DELIVERY	10-14 Days								21-30 Days					10-14 DAYS ARO				
LOW PROFILE MINI LIGHT BAR	COMM CODE	COUNTY ID #	COLOR	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER EACH			MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER EACH			MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER EACH		
LOW PROFILE MINI LIGHT BAR, PERMANENT MOUNT	055-57	9184	BLUE/AMBER	North American Signal	9100LED-BA	\$219.00			Federal Signal	454301H-abs	\$285.00			PINNACLE		\$251.25		
LOW PROFILE MINI LIGHT BAR, MAGNETIC MOUNT WITH CIGARETTE LIGHTER PLUG	055-57	9184	BLUE/AMBER	North American Signal	9100LED-M-BA	\$199.95			Federal Signal	454302H-abs	\$295.00			NO BID				
REPLACEMENT BULBS	055-57	3727	N/A			No Bid					No Bid			NO BID				
2 SIDED LED BULBS											No Bid			NO BID				
DELIVERY	10-14 Days								21-30 Days					10-14 DAYS ARO				