

ITB#19-94 JANITORIAL, FOOD AND MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION

ITB# 19-94 JANITORIAL, FOOD AND MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES					BIDDERS NAME			K&L Supply			Inteboro Packaging			Gulf Coast Paper			Pyramid School Products			Groupo GTE			Liber Industrial		
BID OPEN DATE: FRIDAY, OCTOBER 11, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.					ADDRESS			503 Bains St Brookshire, TX 423			114 Bracken Rd Montgomery, NY 12549			437 Commerce Ave. Clute, TX 77531			6510 N. 54th St. Tampa, FL 33610			101 Convention Center #900 Las Vegas, NV 89109			7811 N Shepherd Dr #208 Houston, TX 77088		
LOCATION: PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM					CONTACT PERSON			Mike Braham			Abraham Jeremias			Glenn Williams			Kenneth Miller			Gregg Taylor			David Arteaga		
451 N. VELASCO ST., SUITE 100, ANGLETON, TX 77515					TELEPHONE NO.			281-599-7726			845-782-6800			979-265-6149			800-792-2644 x225			888-237-9797			832-791-2535		
					FAX NUMBER						845-781-2450			979-265-7266			813-621-7688			702-852-0411			832-580-2043		
					EMAIL			klsupply@consolidateetd.net			interboro@frontiernet.net			gwilliams@gulfcoastpaper.com			biddept@pyramidsp.com			admin@thinkGTE.com			david@liberindustrial.com		
COUNTY ID	DESCRIPTION	MFG NAME	MFR PART #	ESTIMATED QUANTITIES	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE			
9014	BAG, BARREL SACK, 76#,12" X 7" X 17", KRAFT BROWN, BBL, 400 CT	B&H	80080	1/PK	SKH75	400/BALE	\$38.00				80080	BALE	48.42			NO BID				13200056e	400/cs	\$31.77			
7598	BAGS, TRASH, 23" X 33", 12-16 GAL, .30 MIL, BLACK, STAR BOTTOM	CONCORD	2336M	Liber	2336M	1000 EA	\$21.00	INT-2433-Reg; As Per Sample #7598A	1,000/Case; Mfr: IBS/Capital; Manufactured in Texas	\$ 24.48	23336	CASE	15.24			NO BID									
7597	BAGS, TRASH, 24" X 33", 8 MC, HIGH DENSITY, 12-16 GAL, STAR BOTTOM, NATURAL COLOR	BERRY	HR243308N	6/CS	2433L	1000 EA	\$21.00	INT-2433-Reg; As Per Sample #7597A	1,000/Case; Mfr: IBS/Capital; Manufactured in Texas	\$ 24.48	24338	CASE	20.52			NO BID									
7906	BAGS, TRASH, 33" X 40", 1.5 MIL, 33 GAL, DARK COLOR, STAR BOTTOM	PINNACLE	P40STL	5/CS	40STL	100/CASE	\$18.00	INT-3340-Super Exh; As Per Sample #7906A	100/Case; Mfr: Glopak/IBS/Capital; Manufactured in Texas	\$ 15.68	P40STL	CASE	17.00			NO BID				H9150015	100/cs	\$ 12.86			
7596	BAGS, TRASH, 40" X 48", 16 MC, 40-45 GAL, STAR BOTTOM, NATURAL	RHINO	40816N	3/CS	4048 1.6	250/CASE	\$23.50	INT-4048-XH; As Per Sample #7596A	250/Case; Mfr: IBS/Capital; Manufactured in Texas	\$ 27.82	404816	CASE	22.71			NO BID				H9150008	250/cs	\$ 20.06			
7601	BAGS, TRASH, 45"X50" GAL, WHITE	B&H	2645/P16TY	4/CS	2640/P1	1000/CASE	\$17.00	INT-4550-Super Exh; As Per Sample #7601A	100/Case; Mfr: Glopak/IBS/Capital; Manufactured in Texas	\$ 34.82						NO BID									
7595	BAGS, TRASH, SILVER, 39" X 57", 1.7 MIL, 55/60 GAL, STAR BOTTOM, DARK COLOR	PINNACLE	P56STL	35/CS	585TL	50/CASE	\$17.00	INT-3957-Super XH; As Per Sample #7595A	50/Case; Mfr: Glopak/IBS/Capital; manufactured in Texas	\$ 18.72	P56STL		15.84			NO BID									
9418	BAGS, TRASH,50"X60",BLACK,,2.0 ML,55-65 GAL, 100/CS	CONCORD	5060BLK	19/CS	5060BLK	50/CASE	\$35.00	INT-5060-Super Ex-Hvy; As Per Sample #9418A	100/Case; Mfr: Glopak/IBS/Capital; Manufactured in Texas	\$ 47.32						NO BID									
6366	BLEACH, (1 GAL)	KIK	10BLCH3	15/CS	N/A		N/A				10BLCH	3X1	9.35			NO BID									
6368	BLEACH, 6%, 1 GAL	KIK	6BLCH	12/CS	N/A		N/A				6BLCH1	6X1	13.35			NO BID									
6372	BLOCK, URINAL DEODORIZING SENTRY W/SCREEN, PLIABLE VINYL, 3 OZ	FRESH	USPB/12	1/DZ	12/USPS	DOZEN	\$17.50							FRESH 3USPB	DOZEN	\$ 19.99									
6373	BLOCK, URINAL DEODORIZING, 3 OZ., LAST 30 DAYS	FRESH	3-Dec	10/DZ	URINAL BLOCK	DOZEN	\$7.00				URINALBLOC K	12/12/CASE	5.90	FRESH 4BOS-PKG	12/PKG	\$ 5.99									
6547	BOTTLE, SPRAY, PLASTIC, FULL QUART CAPASITY, TRANSLUCENT	TALCO	120125	2/EA	32oz/CLEAR	DOZEN	\$18.80							120125 (BOTTLE ONLY)	EACH	\$ 0.52									
6377	FLO PAC 24" PALMYRA HEAVY FLOOR GARAGE SWEEP, HEAD ONLY	CARLISLE	3621912400	2/EA	10,824.00	EACH	\$14.50							ABCO BH12003	EACH	\$ 6.99									
6378	FLO PAC 36" PALMYRA GARAGE SWEEP, HEAD ONLY	CARLISLE	3621913600	2/EA	N/A		N/A							ABCO BH12005	EACH	\$ 13.98									

ITB#19-94 JANITORIAL, FOOD AND MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION

ITB# 19-94 JANITORIAL, FOOD AND MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES				BIDDERS NAME			K&L Supply			Inteboro Packaging			Gulf Coast Paper			Pyramid School Products			Groupo GTE			Liber Industrial		
BID OPEN DATE: FRIDAY, OCTOBER 11, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.				ADDRESS			503 Bains St Brookshire, TX 423			114 Bracken Rd Montgomery, NY 12549			437 Commerce Ave. Clute, TX 77531			6510 N. 54th St. Tampa, FL 33610			101 Convention Center #900 Las Vegas, NV 89109			7811 N Shepherd Dr #208 Houston, TX 77088		
LOCATION: PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM 451 N. VELASCO ST., SUITE 100, ANGLETON, TX 77515				CONTACT PERSON			Mike Braham 281-599-7726			Abraham Jeremias 845-782-6800			Glenn Williams 979-265-6149			Kenneth Miller 800-792-2644 x225			Gregg Taylor 888-237-9797			David Arteaga 832-791-2535		
				TELEPHONE NO.			281-599-7726			845-782-6800			979-265-6149			800-792-2644 x225			888-237-9797			832-791-2535		
				FAX NUMBER						845-781-2450			979-265-7266			813-621-7688			702-852-0411			832-580-2043		
				EMAIL			klsupply@consolidateetd.net			interboro@frontiernet.net			gwilliams@gulfcoastpaper.com			biddept@pyramidsp.com			admin@thinkGTE.com			david@liberindustrial.com		
COUNTY ID	DESCRIPTION	MFG NAME	MFR PART #	ESTIMATED QUANTITIES	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE		
6379	BROOM, ANGLER 13" LARGE PLASTIC FLAGGED, 42" LONG WOOD HANDLE	UNISAN	UNS932A	9/DZ	832A	DOZEN	\$94.00				BWK932M	DOZEN	143.75	UNISAN UNS932A	DOZEN	\$ 103.08								
6381	BROOM, WAREHOUSE, YUCCA & CORN FIBERS, HEAVY DUTY , 42" LONG	UNISAN	UN6932Y	4/DZ	UN6932Y	DOZEN	\$99.00				BWK6932YEA	EACH	10.05	ABCO BR28SE	DOZEN	\$ 83.88								
6382	BROOM, WHISK, CORN, 10"	UNISAN	UNS951WC	6/DZ	UNS951WC	DOZEN	\$58.00				BWK951WC	DOZEN	47.62	ABCI BH10020	DOZEN	\$ 35.76								
6375	BROOM,24" GARAGE BRUSH, PLASTIC, 60"X148", NO HANDLE	BOARDWALK	BWK20424	2/EA	BWK20424	DOZEN	\$12.00				BWK20424	EACH	16.15	ABCO BH11008	EACH	\$ 7.89								
6518	BUCKET, MOP, 26 QT, WRINGER, 780 COMBO PACK	RCP	7580	3/EA	7580 E	EACH	\$60.00				7580	EACH	59.99	D FG758088YEL	EACH	\$ 49.98				63872804e	1ea	\$ 47.51		
6386	BUS BOX, DUR-X UNDIVIDED, 7-5/8 GAL, GRAY,ROUND CORNERS	RCP	RCP3351	1/EA	RCP3351	EACH	\$18.00				RCP3351EA	EACH	20.65			NO BID								
6396	CHEMICAL, POOL, SMALL TABS,24 HOUR CHLORINE, 7 OZ 3" DIA PUCKS, 25 LB CONTAINER	SCP	3T	1/EA	3T	BUCKET	\$89.00									NO BID								
6409	CLEANER, BOWL, DISINFECTANT, DEODORIZES, NON-ACID, 32 OZ	SPARTAN	7116	14/CS	NABC	12/32oz	\$18.00				7116	12 QT CASE	17.67			NO BID								
7578	CLEANER, BOWL, DISINFECTANT, PRETTY POTTY, 12 X 1 QT/CS	TIDAL WAVE	BARNACLE	23/CS	BOWL BRITE	12/32oz	\$31.00				BARNACLE	12 QT CASE	25.73			NO BID								
7579	CLEANER, BOWL, DISINFECTANT, PRETTY POTTY, GAL	SPARTAN	7496	20/CS	N/A	N/A					7496	12 QT CASE	28.43			NO BID								
8151	CLEANER, BOWL, GERMICIDAL, 23% HCI ACID, (12X32 OZ)	SPARTAN	7120	3/CS	GLITTER	12/32oz	\$35.00				7120	12 QT CASE	24.85			NO BID								
6431	CLEANER, DEGREASER, RTU, INDUSTRIAL STRENGTH, 32 OZ, ALL PURPOSE	SPARTAN	2034	1/CS	LEIMON POWER	12/32oz	\$40.00				2034	12 QT CASE	28.08			NO BID								
6450	CLEANER, DISINFECTANT, AROMA LIQUID, ADVANCE CHEMICAL, PH NEUTRAL, 55 GAL,	CONCORD	AROMA/55	8/DRM	AROMA/55	55 GAL DR	\$408.00				3297-55	55 GALLON				NO BID								
7581	CLEANER, DISINFECTANT, CONSUME ECO-LYZER NEUTRAL, 4X 1 GAL/CS	SPARTAN	3297-4	5/CS	AROMA 4X1	4X1 CASE	\$40.00				3297-4	4 GALLON CASE	44.08			NO BID								
6420	CLEANER, FLOOR STRIDE, CITRUS, LIQUID, ALL PURPOSE, 1 GAL, ODOR COUNTERACTANT	JWAX	903904	1/CS	N/A	N/A					903904	4 GALLON CASE	19.43			NO BID								
6417	CLEANER, FLOOR, FINISHED, NO RINSE, OPEN LOOP, 1 GAL, MR CLEAN	P & G	PGC02621CT	1/CS	2821CT	3X1 CASE	\$42.00				PGC02621CT	3 GALLON CASE	40.10	MR CLEAN PGC02621CT	CASE OF 3	\$ 69.98								
6406	CLEANER, FOAMY TUB & TILE DISINFECTANT, AEROSOL,18OZ, FOR WASHROOMS	SPARTAN	6343	3/CS	6343A	12/18oz	\$29.80				6343	12 X 18OZ	35.00			NO BID								
6422	CLEANER, GLASS RTU, LIQUID AMMONIA-BASED, 32 OZ	SPARTAN	3261	8/CS	GLASS BRITE	12/32OZ	\$20.00				3261	12 QT CASE	21.50			NO BID								
7233	CLEANER, GLASS, AEROSOL, SPARTAN, 12 X 18 OZ / CASE	SPARTAN	6217	20/DZ	GLASS SHINE	12/17oz	\$30.00				6217	12 X 18OZ	27.00			NO BID								
6423	CLEANER, GLASS, LIQUID AMMONIA-BASED, NON STREAKING, 1GAL	SPARTAN	3030	2/CS	SPARKLE	4X1 CASE	\$30.00				3030	4 GALLON CASE	20.90			NO BID								
6425	CLEANER, GRILL, BRICK, 8 X 4 X 3-1/2	ROYAL	RGB49	4/CS	G BRICK	12/ CASE	\$22.00				GBRICK		15.22			NO BID				75000175e	12/cs	\$ 17.17		
7193	CLEANER, METAQUAT GERMICIDE, SPARTAN, 4 X 1 GAL / CS	SPARTAN	1013-4	5/CS	1013-4	4X1 CASE	\$39.90									NO BID								
7588	CLEANER, METAQUAT GERMICIDE, SPARTAN, 55 GAL	SPARTAN	1013-55	1/DRM	1013-55	55 GAL DR	\$399.99									NO BID								

ITB#19-94 JANITORIAL, FOOD AND MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION

ITB# 19-94 JANITORIAL, FOOD AND MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES				BIDDERS NAME				K&L Supply			Inteboro Packaging			Gulf Coast Paper			Pyramid School Products			Groupo GTE			Liber Industrial		
BID OPEN DATE: FRIDAY, OCTOBER 11, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.				ADDRESS				503 Bains St			114 Bracken Rd			437 Commerce Ave.			6510 N. 54th St.			101 Convention Center #900			7811 N Shepherd Dr #208		
LOCATION: PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM				CONTACT PERSON				Mike Braham			Abraham Jeremias			Glenn Williams			Kenneth Miller			Gregg Taylor			David Arteaga		
451 N. VELASCO ST., SUITE 100, ANGLETON, TX 77515				TELEPHONE NO.				281-599-7726			845-782-6800			979-265-6149			800-792-2644 x225			888-237-9797			832-791-2535		
				FAX NUMBER							845-781-2450			979-265-7266			813-621-7688			702-852-0411			832-580-2043		
				EMAIL				klsupply@consolidateetd.net			interboro@frontiernet.net			gwilliams@gulfcoastpaper.com			biddept@pyramidsp.com			admin@thinkGTE.com			david@liberindustrial.com		
COUNTY ID	DESCRIPTION	MFG NAME	MFR PART #	ESTIMATED QUANTITIES	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE			
6427	CLEANER, OVEN, RTU, QUICK PENETRATING, LEMON SCENTED, 32 OZ	SPARTAN	3194	3/CS	OVEN RTU	12/32oz	\$29.00				3194	12 QT CASE	26.54			NO BID									
6401	CLEANER, RESTROOM, ACID DISINFECTANT, MINT, SPARKLING, 32 OZ	SPARTAN	7118	3/CS	SPARKLING	12/32oz	\$24.00				7118	12 QT CASE	20.22			NO BID									
6404	CLEANER,DISINFECTING ALL PURPOSE SPRAY & GLASS CLEANER, 1 GAL, SPIC N SPAN	P & G	PGC58773CT	6/CS	58773CT	3X1 CASE	\$39.99				PGC58773CT	3 GALLON CASE	50.30		SPAN PGC58773CT	CASE OF 3	\$	66.98							
6405	CLEANER,WASHROOM, FOAMY, FLORAL, DUAL ACID, FOR SHOWERS & LOCKER ROOMS, 32 OZ	SPARTAN	3200	15/CS	3,200.00	12/32 oz	\$49.99				3200	12 QT CASE	28.86			NO BID									
6432	DEGREASER, NATURAL ORANGE SOLVENT, RTU,REMOVES MARKS, TAR,GUM, OIL,GREASE AND OTHER DIFFICULT SOILS	SPARTAN	2216	4/CS	2,216.00	12/32oz	\$50.00				2216	4 GALLON CASE	33.98			NO BID									
6438	DEODORIZIER,DRIP, RESTROOM, FRESH SCENT, 32 OZ	SPARTAN	580300	18/CS	580,300.00	12/32 oz	\$55.50				5803	12 QT CASE	69.30			NO BID									
6449	DETERGENT, LAUNDRY, 100 LB DRUM,	CONCORD	OPTI BRITE	7/DRM	OPTI BRITE	PAIL	\$109.99				PREMIER 50	50# BOX	19.18			NO BID				47560076e	1	\$ 39.42			
7583	DISINFECTANT, DEODORANT, LYSOL SPRAY, 12 X 19 OZ/CS	SPARTAN	6075	3/CS	6075A	12/18oz	\$74.70				6075	12 X 15 OZ CASE	34.78		LYSOL RAC04650CT	12-19 OZ CANS/CASE	\$	80.98							
6454	DISINFECTANT, DEODORANT, STERI-PHENE, SPRING BREEZE, 15 OZ, KILLS MOST DISEASE AND GERMS	SPARTAN	6075	8/DZ	6075A	12/15oz	\$60.00				6075	12 X 15 OZ CASE	34.78		CHASE/SPRAYPAK 433-4104	12-16 OZ CANS/CASE	\$	29.98							
6456	DISINFECTANT, QUATERNARY WITH SURFACTANT CLEANING SYSTEM, LEMON FRESH, 1 GAL	TIDAL WAVE	LEMON	3/CS	LEMON	4X1 CASE	\$39.95				LEMON1	4 GALLON CASE	38.48			NO BID									
6555	DOLLY, FOR 20 32, 44 AND 55 GAL CONTAINERS, BLACK, BRUTE	RCP	2640G	1/EA	2640G	EACH	\$30.00				2640G	EACH	20.00		RUBBERMAID 2640	EACH	\$	27.88			638733171e	1	\$ 25.76		
6460	DUSTMOP, FRAME, 36 X 5	NEXTSTEP	96136	1/EA	536DMF	EACH	\$5.00				96136	EACH	3.25		ABCO BH24536	EACH	\$	2.99							
6472	FRESHENER, AIR-METERED, AEROSOL, MANGO SCENT, 7 OZ, TIMEMIST	VECTAIRE	AERO-10	5/CS	TIME MIST	12/7oz	\$40.00								HOSPECO 07929	12-7 OZ CANS/CASE	\$	30.98							
6479	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, LATEX, LG, 5MIL, WHITE, POWDERED, ROLLED CUFF	HOSPECO	GL-L105PL	5/CS	GL-L105PL	10/100 CASE	\$34.95		First Care/JobGuard-Lrg-LG; As Per Sample #6479	1,000/Case; Mfr: Spring-Fill	\$	38.00	L105PL	10 X10	35.25	HOSPECO GL-L105PL	100/BX 10 BX/CASE	\$	38.90						
6480	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, LATEX, XLG, 5MIL, WHITE, POWDERED, ROLLED CUFF	HOSPECO	GL-L105PX	7/CS	GL-L105PLX	10/100 CASE	\$34.95		First Care/JobGuard-XL-LG; As Per Sample #6480	1,000/Case;Mfr : Spring-Fill	\$	38.00	L105PX	10 X10	35.25	HOSPECO GL-105PX	100/BX 10 BX/CASE	\$	38.90						
6489	GLOVES, LATEX, FLOCKLINED, SIZE 9, GREEN COLOR	HOSPECO	GL-L116L	1/CS	GL-L116L		\$60.00						L116L	10 X10	61.25	HOSPECO GL-L116L	12 PR/BOX 10 BX/CASE	\$	60.90						
7584	GLOVES, NITRILE, DISPOSABLE, POWDER-FREE, TEXTURED, SIZE LARGE	HOSPECO	GL-N106L	8/CS	GL-N106L	10/100 CASE	\$49.00		First Care/Aurelia-Lrg-NPFG; As Per Sample #7584	1,000/Case;Mfr : Spring-Fill/Supemax	\$	38.00	N106L	10 X10	151.25	TRADEX NLG400	100/BX 10 BX/CASE	\$	39.90		75000594e	10/cs	\$ 47.72		

ITB#19-94 JANITORIAL, FOOD AND MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION

ITB# 19-94 JANITORIAL, FOOD AND MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES				BIDDERS NAME			K&L Supply			Inteboro Packaging			Gulf Coast Paper			Pyramid School Products			Groupo GTE			Liber Industrial		
BID OPEN DATE: FRIDAY, OCTOBER 11, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.				ADDRESS			503 Bains St Brookshire, TX 423			114 Bracken Rd Montgomery, NY 12549			437 Commerce Ave. Clute, TX 77531			6510 N. 54th St. Tampa, FL 33610			101 Convention Center #900 Las Vegas, NV 89109			7811 N Shepherd Dr #208 Houston, TX 77088		
LOCATION: PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM				CONTACT PERSON			Mike Braham			Abraham Jeremias			Glenn Williams			Kenneth Miller			Gregg Taylor			David Arteaga		
451 N. VELASCO ST., SUITE 100, ANGLETON, TX 77515				TELEPHONE NO.			281-599-7726			845-782-6800			979-265-6149			800-792-2644 x225			888-237-9797			832-791-2535		
				FAX NUMBER						845-781-2450			979-265-7266			813-621-7688			702-852-0411			832-580-2043		
				EMAIL			klsupply@consolidateetd.net			interboro@frontiernet.net			gwilliams@gulfcoastpaper.com			biddept@pyramidsp.com			admin@thinkGTE.com			david@liberindustrial.com		
COUNTY ID	DESCRIPTION	MFG NAME	MFR PART #	ESTIMATED QUANTITIES	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE		
7585	GLOVES, NITRILE, DISPOSABLE, POWDER-FREE, TEXTURED, SIZE X-LARGE	HOSPECO	GL-N106XL	5/BX	GL-N106XL	10/100 CASE	\$49.00	First Care/Aurelia-XL NPF; As Per Sample #7585	1,000/Case;Mfr : Spring-Fill/Supermax	\$ 38.00	N106LXL	10 X 10		TRADEX NXL400	100/BX 10 BX/CASE	\$ 39.90					10/cs	\$ 47.42		
7235	GLOVES, POWDER-FREE, DISPOSABLE, LATEX EXAM, GCP69318L, SIZE L	HOSPECO	GL-L105FL	1/CS	GL-L105FL	10/100 CASE	\$40.00	First Care/JobGuard-Lrg-LPFG-E; As Per Sample #7235	1,000/Case;Mfr : Spring-Fill	\$ 40.00	L105FL	10 X 10	37.25	TRADEX LLG5201	100/BX 10 BX/CASE	\$ 37.90								
7586	GLOVES, VERSATOUCH, ANSELL, VINYL, 5 MIL, LARGE, 100/BOX	HOSPECO	GL-V103FL	2/CS	GL-V103FL	10/100 CASE	\$29.00				V103FL	10 X 10		TRADEX VLG5101	100/BX 10 BX/CASE	\$ 28.90								
6383	HANDLE, BROOM, WOOD, 60" WITH METAL THREADED TIP	UNISAN	136	4/EA	136 E	EACH	\$5.00				136	EACH	4.50	ABCO 01104	12 EA/CASE	\$ 33.48								
6519	HANDLE, MOP, 60", FIBERGLASS, JANITOR, CAMLOCK	BOARDWALK	BWK620	14/EA	5820E	EACH	\$9.00				BWK620	EACH	7.89	ABCO 01208NB	EACH	\$ 7.99								
6520	HANDLE, MOP, 60", SNAP ON FIBERGLASS DUST MOP HANDLE	UNISAN	RCPM146	14/EA	626E	EACH	\$10.00				RCP146M	EACH	21.45	RUBBERMAID M146	EACH	\$ 8.99								
6523	HANDLE, MOP, 60", WOOD JAWS LOOP FOR 5" HEADBAND MOP	CCP	A70602	4/EA	60J	EACH	\$9.99							CONTINENTAL A70602	EACH	\$ 7.98								
6461	HANDLE, DUSTMOP, CLIPON 15/16 X 60"	CCP	C801060	1/EA	C801	EACH	\$12.99							CONTINENTAL C801060	EACH	\$ 4.99								
6602	INSECTICIDE WITH DURSBN BUCKETS WITH SPRAYERS	CONCORD	VIPER	20/CS	VIPER	4X1 CASE	\$109.99									NO BID								
6603	INSECTICIDE, WASP AND HORNET , 17 OZ	SPARTAN	6820	8/CS	CONCORD WK	12/17oz	\$49.99				6820	12 X 17OZ CASE	40.70	CHASE 4108	12-20 OZ CANS/CASE	\$ 43.99								
8159	LAUNDRY DERTEGENT	MONTGOMERY	47562500	75/BX	PREMIER	50# BOX	\$20.00									NO BID								
6531	MOP, BLUE FINISH HEAD, MEDIUM, FASTTRACK, 1-1/4"HEADBAND, LOOPED END, USE WITH CLAMP OR GRIPPER STYLE HANDLES	UNISAN	UNS542	5/DZ	UNS542	DOZEN	\$99.00				BWK542CT	DOZEN	116.30	ABCO LM203MCSNB	DOZEN	\$ 47.76								
6517	MOP, DECK, WOOD HANDLE, COTTON, 24 OZ	UNISAN	124C	1/DZ	124C	DOZEN	\$98.00				BWK124C	DOZEN	50.58	ABCO C050024	DOZEN	\$ 44.28								
6459	MOP, DUST, DISPOSABLE, 36" X 5	UNISAN	UNS5X36	1/EA	UNS163L	DOZEN	\$96.00							GREENWOOD 00607	EACH	\$ 3.94								
6526	MOP, HEAD ONLY, 16 OZ, RAYON, LIE FLAT	NEXTSTEP	97916-SG	2/EA	16RLF	EACH	\$5.00							ABCO RM3216S	EACH	\$ 3.59								
6527	MOP, HEAD, COTTON, FULL OUNCE, 32 OZ, 1" MESH HEADBAND, GENERAL PURPOSE	NEXTSTEP	97732V	5/EA	32CCL	DRUM	\$89.90							ABCO CM20032	EACH	\$ 3.39								
6608	PADS, FEMININE, SANITARY, MAXITHINS	HOSPECO	MT4	9/CS	GUARDS	250/CASE	\$49.003X20				MT4		30.00	HOSPECO MT4	250/CASE	\$ 29.98								
6532	PADS, SCOURING, MICROTRON PAD, 6" X 9" X 1/4", GREEN, MEDIUM DUTY	PREMIERE	PAD196	2/CS	PAD196	3X20 CASE	\$14.00				96HP		35.81	ACS SO96	60/CASE	\$ 10.99								
6467	PADS, FLOOR, STRIP, 17"	PREMIERE	PAD4017	7/CS	PAD4017	5/CASE	\$12.00				17BS	CASE5 PER	11.00	ACS 72-17	5/CASE	\$ 8.99								
6462	PAN, DUST, HEAVY DUTY, 8-1/8" X 12-1/4" X 12-1/4", CHARCOL COLOR	RCP	2005	1/EA	2005 E	EACH	\$4.00				2005	EACH	2.60	RUBBERMAID 2005	EACH	\$ 1.98								

ITB#19-94 JANITORIAL, FOOD AND MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION

ITB# 19-94 JANITORIAL, FOOD AND MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES				BIDDERS NAME				K&L Supply			Inteboro Packaging			Gulf Coast Paper			Pyramid School Products			Groupo GTE			Liber Industrial		
BID OPEN DATE: FRIDAY, OCTOBER 11, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.				ADDRESS				503 Bains St			114 Bracken Rd			437 Commerce Ave.			6510 N. 54th St.			101 Convention Center #900			7811 N Shepherd Dr #208		
LOCATION: PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM				CONTACT PERSON				Mike Braham			Abraham Jeremias			Glenn Williams			Kenneth Miller			Gregg Taylor			David Arteaga		
451 N. VELASCO ST., SUITE 100, ANGLETON, TX 77515				TELEPHONE NO.				281-599-7726			845-782-6800			979-265-6149			800-792-2644 x225			888-237-9797			832-791-2535		
				FAX NUMBER							845-781-2450			979-265-7266			813-621-7688			702-852-0411			832-580-2043		
				EMAIL				klsupply@consolidateetd.net			interboro@frontiernet.net			gwilliams@gulfcoastpaper.com			biddept@pyramidsp.com			admin@thinkGTE.com			david@liberindustrial.com		
COUNTY ID	DESCRIPTION	MFG NAME	MFR PART #	ESTIMATED QUANTITIES	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE			
6548	SPRAYERS, TRIGGER, W/TUBE FILTER, 9-1/4"DIP TUBE, RED/WHITE, FOR QUART BOTTLES	TOLCO	902RW9	10/EA	902RW9	EACH	\$1.50				TRIGQT		0.49	TOLCO 902RW9	EACH	\$ 0.59									
6468	SWEEP, FLOOR, COMPOUND MFG W/SCREENED SAWDUST, MAX DUST ABSORPTION & COVERAGE, FOR WOOD OR CEMENT,50LBS	SORB-ALL	50 OILBS	4/EA	SORB ALL	50#	\$20.00				50OILBS		15.42			NO BID									
6552	TABLE COVER, POLY, 40" X 300', WHITE, CUT TO FIT ROLL	BERRYA	2TCW300C	2/RL	503T	40X300	\$19.80									NO BID									
7605	TAMPONS	HOSPECO	MT500	1/CS	MT500	500/CASE	\$65.00				MT500		52.71	HOSPECO T500	500/CASE	\$ 55.98									
6575	TISSUE, FACIAL, 2PLY, WHITE, 8-1/4" X 8-3/4", KLEENEX	KC	21400	8/CS	21400W	36/CASE	\$39.95				KC21400		35.64	KLEENEX 21400	36 BX/CASE	\$ 51.99									
6578	TISSUE, TOILET, 2 PLY COMPACT CORELESS	GP	GP19378	7/CS	GP19378	18X1500	\$75.00				GP19378		35.30			NO BID									
6577	TISSUE, TOILET, 2 PLY JUMBO ROLL	GP	12798	5/CS	12798J	8X1000	\$24.90				GP12798		21.18			NO BID									
6580	TISSUE, TOILET, 2 PLY, JRT JR JUMBO ROLL, SCOTT SURPASS	KC	K7805	35/CS	K7805	12X1000	\$44.90				K7805		31.48			NO BID									
6579	TISSUE, TOILET, 2PLY, 100% BIODEGRADABLE	SUPPLY WORKS	H596	3703/CS	H596	96X500	\$32.00				N12325	96 ROLLS	31.30			NO BID	STLB 2-500-96	CASE	\$27.97						
7666	TOWELS, CENTERPULL, WHITE, 4 ROLLS @567 SHEETS, 7.8"X15'	GP	28143	14/CS	28,143.00	4 ROLL CASE	\$39.95				M725		22.83			NO BID									
6588	TOWEL, MULTIFOLD, 1 PLY, NATURAL	NPS	21500	6/CS	21500M	4000 PER CASE	\$19.95				N21500		15.30			NO BID									
7594	TOWEL, ROLL, 1 PLY, BROWN, 1 1/8" CORE, 7 7/8" X 800', 12/CS	RETAIN	M30700	2/CS	M30700	6 PER CASE	\$29.80				M30700		18.30			NO BID				78000002e	12/cs	\$ 16.66			
7593	TOWEL, ROLL, 1 PLY, BROWN, 2" CORE, 7 7/8" X 350', 12/CS	ESSITY	RK350A	8/CS	26008B	12X350	\$29.80				RK350A		17.65			NO BID									
6590	TOWEL, ROLL, 1 PLY, NATURAL, 1-5/8" CORE, 7-7/8" X 350',12/CS	GP	GP26401	5/CS	GP26401	12X350	\$22.00				RK350A		17.65			NO BID									
6584	TOWEL, ROLL, 2 PLY, KITCHEN, WHITE, 10-7/10" X 11"	CLEAR CHOICE	52231	14/CS	52231W	20X128	\$28.80				GP23700		26.06			NO BID									
6586	TOWEL, ROLL, 2 PLY, KITCHEN, PERFORATED, 11x8.8, WHITE, ROLL DIAMETER, 5.2", 100 SHT	GP	GP27300	18/CS	GP27300	30X85	\$27.00				GP23700		26.06			NO BID									
6591	TOWEL, ROLL, 2PLY, PREFERENCE ULTRA, WHITE, 7-7/8"X350', 1-5/8"CORE	GP	GP28000	6/CS	GP28000	12 ROLLS	\$39.95				GP28000		43.18			NO BID									
6592	TOWEL, ROLL, CENTER PULL, 1 PLY, WHITE, PREMIUM, 1-5/8" CORE (FITS DISPENSER S8201)	GP	GP28124	2/CS	GP28124		\$36.75				GP28125		33.42			NO BID									
6595	TOWEL, SINGLE FOLD, 1PLY, NATURAL, ECONOMY, 10-5/8" X 9-1/2"	SCA	SK1850A	5/CS	23,504.00	16X250	\$19.99				SK1850A		18.36			NO BID									
6589	TOWEL, ULTRA MULTIFOLD, WHITE, 2 PLY PREMIUM, 9-1/2" X 9-1/4"	GP	GP21000	8/CS	GP21000	2000CT	\$21.00				GP21000		20.48			NO BID									
8146	WIPE, DISINFECTING, LYSOL, LEMON/LIME BLOSSOM	LYSOL	77182	13/CS	RAC77182	6R/80	\$34.99				RAC77182CT		33.75	LYSOL 77182	6 TUBS OF 80/CASE	\$ 37.98									
7197	WIPERS, 1 PLY, POP-UP BOX, WYPALL X 70 WORKHORSE, 10/100 / CS,	KC	4145550	33/CS	K4145550	10/100	\$69.95				4145550		76.08			NO BID									

ITB#19-94 JANITORIAL, FOOD AND MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION

ITB# 19-94 JANITORIAL, FOOD AND MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS AND SUPPLIES		BIDDERS NAME			K&L Supply			Inteboro Packaging			Gulf Coast Paper			Pyramid School Products			Groupo GTE			Liber Industrial		
BID OPEN DATE: FRIDAY, OCTOBER 11, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.		ADDRESS			503 Bains St Brookshire, TX 423			114 Bracken Rd Montgomery, NY 12549			437 Commerce Ave. Clute, TX 77531			6510 N. 54th St. Tampa, FL 33610			101 Convention Center #900 Las Vegas, NV 89109			7811 N Shepherd Dr #208 Houston, TX 77088		
LOCATION: PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM 451 N. VELASCO ST., SUITE 100, ANGLETON, TX 77515		CONTACT PERSON			Mike Braham 281-599-7726			Abraham Jeremias 845-782-6800			Glenn Williams 979-265-6149			Kenneth Miller 800-792-2644 x225			Gregg Taylor 888-237-9797			David Arteaga 832-791-2535		
		TELEPHONE NO.			281-599-7726			845-782-6800			979-265-6149			800-792-2644 x225			888-237-9797			832-791-2535		
		FAX NUMBER						845-781-2450			979-265-7266			813-621-7688			702-852-0411			832-580-2043		
		EMAIL			klsupply@consolidateetd.net			interboro@frontiernet.net			gwilliams@gulfcoastpaper.com			biddept@pyramidsp.com			admin@thinkGTE.com			david@liberindustrial.com		
COUNTY ID	DESCRIPTION	MFG NAME	MFR PART #	ESTIMATED QUANTITIES	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE	VENDOR PART #	VENDOR UOM PKG (SOLD AS)	VENDOR PKG PRICE
6599	WIPERS, TERI, 2PLY, WHITE, 9-3/4"X16-7/8", 10/126 POP UP BOX	KC	434790	2/CS	434790W	10/ CASE	\$64.95				434790		62.75			NO BID						
9464	CLEANER, FLOOR, DAMP MOP, NEUTRAL DISINFECTANT, LEMON SCENT, 4X1 GAL/CASE	SPARTAN	106204	1/CS	10DMQ16204	4X1 CASE	\$39.95				106204		29.65			NO BID						
9510	SANITIZER, HAND, INSTANT, HYPOALLERGENIC, 8 OZ PUMP BOTTLE	PURELL	9652-12	10/CS	9652-12	12/8oz	\$44.95				GOJ965212CT		48.06	PURELL 9652-12	12/CASE	\$ 46.98						
9511	CLEANSER, AJAX OXYGEN BLEACH 21OZ 24/CS	AJAX	CPC14278C	1/CS	CPC14278C	24/ CASE	\$36.80				CPC14278C		26.15	AJAX CPC14278C T	1 -21 OZ/CAS	38.98						
6337	ALUMINUM FOIL, EXTRA HEAVY DUTY	NOVA	N181000H	20/RL	BOARDWALD	1/500	\$59.95				624		26.15			NO BID						
6338	ALUMINUM FOIL, EXTRA HEAVY DUTY	EMPRESS	E70815	2/RL	REN164	1/500	\$39.95									NO BID						
6340	BAG, SANDWICH WAX PAPER, SQUARE-OPEN END, 3" x 1 3/4" x 6 1/2"	SPECIALTY	1201	15/PKG	1201W	8X1000	\$15.49									NO BID						
6341	BAG, RESEALABLE STORAGE GALLON SIZE	FANTAPAK	P-STORAGE-G	1/CS	FB GAL	250	\$14.95									NO BID						
6342	BAG, RESEALABLE STORAGE QT 1.75MIL	FANTAPAK	P-STORAGE-Q	27/CS	FB QUART	500	\$16.50									NO BID						
6343	BAG, ICE 10#, 11" X 21" PLAIN POLY	ELKAY	10PPIB	3/CS	10PPIB	1000	\$54.95				10PPPIB		53.66			NO BID						
6344	BOWL, 12 OZ WHITE SATIN PLACESETTER SATIN TABLEWARE	DART	BWWCR/12BW	1/CS	12BWWCR/12 BWWC	8/125	\$27.90									NO BID						
6345	CAN FUEL, JELLED 6 HOURS	BRADFORD HALL	CYWP-6	1/CS	CYWP-6	24/ CASE	\$69.90									NO BID						
6389	CUPS, 8 OZ STYROFOAM	DART	8j8	50/CS	8j8	25/40	\$29.95				8J8		23.00			NO BID						
6347	CUPS, 10 OZ STYROFOAM	DART	10j10	3/CS	10j10	25/40	\$35.95				10J10		29.50			NO BID						
6348	CUPS, 12 OZ STYROFOAM	DART	12J12	1/CS	12J12	25X40	\$39.00				12J12		32.95			NO BID						
6350	CUPS, 14 OZ STYROFOAM	DART	14J16	2/CS	14J16	25X40	\$49.95				14J16		43.00			NO BID						
6387	CUPS, 16 OZ STYROFOAM	DART	16J16	1/CS	16J16	25X40	\$54.90				16J16		46.60			NO BID						
6351	CUPS, CONE WATER CUP ROLLEDRIM, 4-1/4 OZ	KONIE	4.5KR	13/CS	4.5KR	25X200	\$50.00									NO BID						
6612	CUPS, 5 OZ. PLASTIC TRANSLUCENT	DART	5N25	1/CS	5N25	2000CT	\$50.00				RK5		40.14			NO BID						
6352	CUPS, 7 OZ PLASTIC TRANSLUCENT	DART	7N25	4/CS	7N25	5M CS	\$69.27				7N25		49.40			NO BID						
6353	NON FLUTED CUPS, BAKING PAPER, 1 1/4" X 2 1/4, WHITE LOTUS	HOFFMASTER	611110	1/CS	611110B	1000	\$69.95									NO BID						
6354	PICPAK, SEN PARTY PACKS WITH KNIFE, FORK, SPOON, SALT & PEPPER, NAPKIN (INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED)	EMPRESS	E176000	1/CS	E176000	250	\$23.95									NO BID						

