

BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEET

ITB# 18-89 ROAD STRIPING AND PAVEMENT MARKERS		BIDDERS NAME		Batterson LLP		Stripe Lines Inc		Texas Lone Star Pavement Services, LLC		Traffic Signs & Lines LLC	
CONTRACT TERM:		ADDRESS		6800 Dixie Dr.		5430 Killough St.		27045 Hanna Rd.		914 Broadway Ave.	
OCTOBER 23, 2019 TO OCTOBER 22, 2020		CONTACT NAME		Houston, TX 77087		Houston, TX 77086		Conroe, TX 77385		Pasadena, TX 77506	
		PHONE NUMBER		Stacy Batterson		Dan Batterson		Jim Schutze		Jose Medrano	
		EMAIL		713-688-5433		281-598-0651		281-367-1965		346-444-0043	
				<a href="mailto:stace@batterson.com">stace@batterson.com</a>		<a href="mailto:dan@stripelinesinc.com">dan@stripelinesinc.com</a>		<a href="mailto:striping@lonestarpavementservices.com">striping@lonestarpavementservices.com</a>		<a href="mailto:trafficsignsandlines@gmail.com">trafficsignsandlines@gmail.com</a>	
Items	Item No	Units	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	
REFL PAV MRK TY I (W)4"(BRK)(100MIL)	666 6003	LF	\$0.37	\$0.38	\$0.61	\$0.45					
*REFL PAV MRK TY I (W)4"(SLD)(100MIL)	666 XXXX	LF	\$0.30	\$0.37	\$0.61	\$0.40					
REFL PAV MRK TY I (W)4"(DOT)(100MIL)	666 6006	LF	\$0.81	\$0.90	\$0.61	\$0.70					
*REFL PAV MRK TY I (W)12"(SLD)(100MIL)	666 6042	LF	\$3.00	\$2.65	\$1.45	\$2.00					
REFL PAV MRK TY I (W)24"(SLD)(100MIL)	666 6048	LF	\$6.00	\$5.95	\$3.00	\$4.00					
REFL PAV MRK TY I (W)(ARROW)(100MIL)	666 6054	EA	\$120.00	\$95.00	\$100.00	\$95.00					
REFL PAV MRK TY I (W)(NUMBER)(100MIL)	666 6075	EA	\$120.00	\$60.00	\$30.00	\$65.00					
REFL PAV MRK TY I (W)(WORD)(100MIL)	666 6078	EA	\$130.00	\$130.00	\$125.00	\$100.00					
REF PAV MRK TY I (W)(MED NOSE)(100MIL)	666 6090	EA	\$250.00	\$130.00	\$200.00	\$190.00					
REFL PAV MRK TY I (W)(RR XING)(100MIL)	666 6093	EA	\$610.00	\$225.00	\$200.00	\$340.00					
REFL PAV MRK TY I (W)(SYMBOL)(100MIL)	666 6096	EA	\$120.00	\$50.00	\$150.00	\$190.00					
REF PAV MRK TY I(W)18"(YLD TRI)(100MIL	666 6099	EA	\$56.00	\$20.00	\$50.00	\$18.00					
REF PAV MRK TY I(W)36"(YLD TRI)(100MIL	666 6102	EA	\$72.00	\$40.00	\$75.00	\$25.00					
REFL PAV MRK TY I (W)(BIKE ARW)(100MIL	666 6105	EA	\$120.00	\$80.00	\$200.00	\$75.00					
RFL PAV MRK TY I(W)BIKE RR XING(100MIL	666 6108	EA	\$190.00	\$150.00	\$150.00	\$145.00					
REFL PAV MRK TY I(W)(BIKE SYML)(100MIL	666 6111	EA	\$130.00	\$80.00	\$100.00	\$100.00					
REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y)4"(DOT)(100MIL)	666 6123	LF	\$0.81	\$0.90	\$0.61	\$0.80					
*REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y)4"(BRK)(100MIL)	666 XXXX	LF	\$0.37	\$0.38	\$0.61	\$0.55					
*REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y)4"(SLD)(100MIL)	666 6126	LF	\$0.30	\$0.37	\$0.61	\$0.40					
REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y)12"(SLD)(100MIL)	666 6141	LF	\$3.00	\$2.70	\$1.45	\$2.00					
REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y)24"(SLD)(100MIL)	666 6147	LF	\$6.00	\$5.95	\$3.00	\$4.00					
REFL PAV MRK TY I(Y)(MED NOSE)(100MIL)	666 6156	EA	\$250.00	\$130.00	\$200.00	\$160.00					
RE PM TY I (ACC PRK)(WHT)(SYMBOL ONLY)	666 6166	EA	\$260.00	\$90.00	\$200.00	\$165.00					
PAVEMENT SEALER 4"	666 6224	LF	\$0.06	\$0.10	\$0.10	\$0.05					
PAVEMENT SEALER 12"	666 6228	LF	\$1.00	\$0.25	\$0.30	\$0.10					
PAVEMENT SEALER 24"	666 6230	LF	\$2.00	\$0.50	\$0.50	\$0.10					
PAVEMENT SEALER (ARROW)	666 6231	EA	\$47.00	\$12.00	\$0.50	\$5.00					
PAVEMENT SEALER (WORD)	666 6232	EA	\$47.00	\$12.00	\$1.00	\$5.00					
PAVEMENT SEALER (MED NOSE)	666 6233	EA	\$79.00	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$25.00					
PAVEMENT SEALER (SYMBOL)	666 6241	EA	\$47.00	\$5.00	\$1.00	\$5.00					
PAVEMENT SEALER (RR XING)	666 6242	EA	\$120.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	\$15.00					
PAVEMENT SEALER (YLD TRI)	666 6243	EA	\$59.00	\$5.00	\$0.25	\$2.00					
PAVEMENT SEALER (BIKE ARROW)	666 6244	EA	\$59.00	\$5.00	\$1.25	\$5.00					

**BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEET**

ITB# 18-89 ROAD STRIPING AND PAVEMENT MARKERS CONTRACT TERM: OCTOBER 23, 2019 TO OCTOBER 22, 2020		BIDDERS NAME ADDRESS CONTACT NAME PHONE NUMBER EMAIL		Batterson LLP 6800 Dixie Dr. Houston, TX 77087 Stacy Batterson 713-688-5433 <a href="mailto:stace@batterson.com">stace@batterson.com</a>	Stripe Lines Inc 5430 Killough St. Houston, TX 77086 Dan Batterson 281-598-0651 <a href="mailto:dan@stripelinesinc.com">dan@stripelinesinc.com</a>	Texas Lone Star Pavement Services, LLC 27045 Hanna Rd. Conroe, TX 77385 Jim Schutze 281-367-1965 <a href="mailto:striping@lonestarpavementservices.com">striping@lonestarpavementservices.com</a>	Traffic Signs & Lines LLC 914 Broadway Ave. Pasadena, TX 77506 Jose Medrano 346-444-0043 <a href="mailto:trafficsignsandlines@gmail.com">trafficsignsandlines@gmail.com</a>
Items	Item No	Units	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	
PAVEMENT SEALER (BIKE SYMBOL)	666 6245	EA	\$59.00	\$3.00	\$1.00	\$5.00	
PAVEMENT SEALER (NUMBER)	666 6248	EA	\$59.00	\$8.00	\$0.50	\$5.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (4") (DOT)	668 6062	LF	\$3.80	\$2.80	\$3.00	\$3.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (4") (SLD)	668 6064	LF	\$2.80	\$2.20	\$3.00	\$2.80	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (8") (DOT)	668 6070	LF	\$6.70	\$4.00	\$4.00	\$5.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (8") (SLD)	668 6072	LF	\$5.10	\$3.40	\$4.00	\$5.10	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (12") (SLD)	668 6074	LF	\$7.20	\$5.30	\$6.50	\$6.80	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (18") (SLD)	668 6075	LF	\$11.00	\$8.20	\$10.50	\$9.50	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (24") (SLD)	668 6076	LF	\$16.00	\$12.50	\$15.00	\$15.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (ARROW)	668 6077	EA	\$280.00	\$220.00	\$300.00	\$230.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (UTURN ARROW)	668 6080	EA	\$380.00	\$320.00	\$450.00	\$380.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (NUMBER)	668 6084	EA	\$280.00	\$120.00	\$100.00	\$200.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (WORD)	668 6085	EA	\$320.00	\$250.00	\$300.00	\$338.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (ISLAND)	668 6088	EA	\$340.00	\$800.00	No Bid	\$650.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (RR XING)	668 6089	EA	\$640.00	\$500.00	\$650.00	\$600.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (SYMBOL)	668 6090	EA	\$260.00	\$200.00	No Bid	\$390.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (18")(YLD TRI)	668 6091	EA	\$41.00	\$40.00	\$15.00	\$25.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (36")(YLD TRI)	668 6092	EA	\$56.00	\$70.00	\$27.00	\$40.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W)(BIKE ARROW)	668 6094	EA	\$140.00	\$190.00	\$200.00	\$130.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W)(BIKE RR XING)	668 6095	EA	\$280.00	\$550.00	No Bid	\$400.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W)(BIKE SYMBOL)	668 6096	EA	\$230.00	\$200.00	No Bid	\$260.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W)(BIKE WORD)	668 6097	EA	\$280.00	\$225.00	\$400.00	\$190.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (Y) (4") (SLD)	668 6101	LF	\$2.80	\$2.20	\$2.50	\$3.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (Y) (12") (SLD)	668 6106	LF	\$7.20	\$5.65	\$7.60	\$7.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (Y) (24") (SLD)	668 6108	LF	\$16.00	\$13.00	\$15.20	\$16.00	
PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (Y) (MED NOSE)	668 6110	EA	\$640.00	\$680.00	No Bid	\$300.00	
*REFL PAV MRKR TY I-A	672 6006	EA	\$4.00	\$3.50	\$7.50	\$2.50	
*REFL PAV MRKR TY I-C	672 6007	EA	\$4.00	\$3.50	\$7.50	\$2.50	
*REFL PAV MRKR TY I-R	672 6008	EA	\$4.00	\$4.00	\$7.50	\$5.00	
*REFL PAV MRKR TY II-A-A	672 6009	EA	\$4.00	\$4.00	\$7.50	\$2.50	
*REFL PAV MRKR TY II-C-R	672 6010	EA	\$4.00	\$4.00	\$7.50	\$2.50	
*TRAFFIC BUTTON TY II-A-A	672 6013	EA	\$5.00	\$4.00	\$7.50	\$3.00	
*TRAFFIC BUTTON TY II-C-R	672 6014	EA	\$5.00	\$4.00	\$7.50	\$3.00	
*TRAFFIC BUTTON TY W	672 6016	EA	\$5.00	\$3.00	\$7.50	\$2.00	
*TRAFFIC BUTTON TY Y	672 6017	EA	\$5.00	\$3.00	\$7.50	\$2.00	

**BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEET**

ITB# 18-89 ROAD STRIPING AND PAVEMENT MARKERS CONTRACT TERM: OCTOBER 23, 2019 TO OCTOBER 22, 2020		BIDDERS NAME ADDRESS CONTACT NAME PHONE NUMBER EMAIL		<b>Batterson LLP</b> <b>6800 Dixie Dr.</b> <b>Houston, TX 77087</b> <b>Stacy Batterson</b> <b>713-688-5433</b> <a href="mailto:stace@batterson.com">stace@batterson.com</a>	<b>Stripe Lines Inc</b> <b>5430 Killough St.</b> <b>Houston, TX 77086</b> <b>Dan Batterson</b> <b>281-598-0651</b> <a href="mailto:dan@stripelinesinc.com">dan@stripelinesinc.com</a>	<b>Texas Lone Star Pavement Services, LLC</b> <b>27045 Hanna Rd.</b> <b>Conroe, TX 77385</b> <b>Jim Schutze</b> <b>281-367-1965</b> <a href="mailto:striping@lonestarpavementservices.com">striping@lonestarpavementservices.com</a>	<b>Traffic Signs &amp; Lines LLC</b> <b>914 Broadway Ave.</b> <b>Pasadena, TX 77506</b> <b>Jose Medrano</b> <b>346-444-0043</b> <a href="mailto:trafficsignsandlines@gmail.com">trafficsignsandlines@gmail.com</a>
Items	Item No	Units	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (4")	677 6001	LF	\$0.40	\$0.28	\$0.60	\$0.15	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (6")	677 6002	LF	\$0.45	\$0.35	\$0.65	\$0.15	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (8")	677 6003	LF	\$0.80	\$0.50	\$0.80	\$0.20	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (10")	677 6004	LF	\$1.00	\$0.60	\$0.85	\$0.20	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (12")	677 6005	LF	\$2.00	\$0.80	\$1.00	\$0.30	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (18")	677 6006	LF	\$3.00	\$1.00	\$1.25	\$0.30	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (24")	677 6007	LF	\$3.00	\$1.20	\$2.00	\$0.30	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (ARROW)	677 6008	EA	\$44.00	\$30.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (DBL ARROW)	677 6009	EA	\$56.00	\$50.00	\$75.00	\$25.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (NUMBER)	677 6011	EA	\$44.00	\$20.00	\$25.00	\$30.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (WORD)	677 6012	EA	\$56.00	\$30.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (ENTR GORE)	677 6013	EA	\$260.00	\$80.00	\$100.00	\$250.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (EXIT GORE)	677 6014	EA	\$260.00	\$80.00	\$100.00	\$250.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (ISLAND)	677 6015	SF	\$200.00	\$2.00	No Bid	\$1.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (RR XING)	677 6016	EA	\$310.00	\$80.00	\$100.00	\$60.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (SYMBOL)	677 6017	EA	\$56.00	\$10.00	\$50.00	\$30.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (18")(YLD TRI)	677 6018	EA	\$44.00	\$5.00	\$20.00	\$5.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (36")(YLD TRI)	677 6019	EA	\$56.00	\$10.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (MED NOSE)	677 6020	EA	\$44.00	\$5.00	No Bid	\$50.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (JIGGLE)	677 6021	EA	\$2.00	\$5.00	\$50.00	\$8.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (SHEILD)	677 6022	EA	\$390.00	\$80.00	\$100.00	\$90.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MARKS (BIKE ARROW)	677 6023	EA	\$56.00	\$15.00	\$50.00	\$15.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MARKS (BIKE SYMBOL)	677 6025	EA	\$56.00	\$15.00	\$50.00	\$15.00	
ELIM EXT PV MRK & MRKS (RUMBLE STRIP)	677 6028	LF	\$3.90	\$0.75	\$100.00	\$2.00	
ELIM EXT PAV MRK & MRKS (UTURN ARROW)	677 6036	EA	\$56.00	\$60.00	\$100.00	\$40.00	
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (4")	678 6001	LF	\$0.05	\$0.02	\$0.05	\$1.00	
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (12")	678 6006	LF	\$0.10	\$0.15	\$0.05	\$1.00	
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (24")	678 6008	LF	\$0.15	\$0.28	\$0.10	\$1.00	
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (ARROW)	678 6009	EA	\$10.00	\$12.00	\$1.00	\$50.00	
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (UTURN ARR)	678 6012	EA	\$10.00	\$15.00	\$1.00	\$10.00	
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (U/LT ARROW)	678 6013	EA	\$10.00	\$15.00	\$1.00	\$15.00	
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (NUMBER)	678 6015	EA	\$10.00	\$5.00	\$0.25	\$10.00	
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (WORD)	678 6016	EA	\$10.00	\$12.00	\$1.00	\$50.00	
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (ENTR GORE)	678 6017	EA	\$130.00	\$40.00	\$5.00	\$60.00	
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (EXIT GORE)	678 6018	EA	\$130.00	\$40.00	\$5.00	\$60.00	

BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEET

ITB# 18-89 ROAD STRIPING AND PAVEMENT MARKERS		BIDDERS NAME		<b>Batterson LLP</b>		<b>Stripe Lines Inc</b>		<b>Texas Lone Star Pavement Services, LLC</b>		<b>Traffic Signs &amp; Lines LLC</b>	
CONTRACT TERM:		ADDRESS		6800 Dixie Dr.		5430 Killough St.		27045 Hanna Rd.		914 Broadway Ave.	
OCTOBER 23, 2019 TO OCTOBER 22, 2020		CONTACT NAME		Houston, TX 77087		Houston, TX 77086		Conroe, TX 77385		Pasadena, TX 77506	
		PHONE NUMBER		Stacy Batterson		Dan Batterson		Jim Schutze		Jose Medrano	
		EMAIL		713-688-5433		281-598-0651		281-367-1965		346-444-0043	
				<a href="mailto:stace@batterson.com">stace@batterson.com</a>		<a href="mailto:dan@stripelinesinc.com">dan@stripelinesinc.com</a>		<a href="mailto:striping@lonestarpavementservices.com">striping@lonestarpavementservices.com</a>		<a href="mailto:trafficsignsandlines@gmail.com">trafficsignsandlines@gmail.com</a>	
Items	Item No	Units	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (RR XING)	678 6020	EA	\$130.00	\$50.00	\$10.00	\$40.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$40.00
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (SYMBOL)	678 6021	EA	\$10.00	\$3.00	\$5.00	\$10.00	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$10.00	\$10.00
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (18")(YLD TRI)	678 6022	EA	\$10.00	\$3.00	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$1.00
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (36")(YLD TRI)	678 6023	EA	\$10.00	\$3.00	\$2.00	\$1.00	\$2.00	\$2.00	\$2.00	\$1.00	\$1.00
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (MED NOSE)	678 6024	EA	\$16.00	\$10.00	No Bid	\$30.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$30.00	\$30.00
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRKS (SHIELD)	678 6025	EA	\$20.00	\$25.00	\$5.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (BIKE ARROW)	678 6026	EA	\$7.90	\$5.00	\$1.00	\$15.00	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$15.00	\$15.00
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (BIKE SYMBOL)	678 6028	EA	\$7.90	\$5.00	\$1.00	\$15.00	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$15.00	\$15.00
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (ACC PRK)(LRG)	678 6031	EA	\$7.90	\$5.00	\$2.00	\$40.00	\$2.00	\$2.00	\$2.00	\$40.00	\$40.00
PAV SURF PREP FOR MRK (RPM)	678 6033	EA	\$0.02	\$1.00	\$0.20	\$2.00	\$0.20	\$0.20	\$0.20	\$2.00	\$2.00