

**BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION
ITB # 18-18 TREE TRIMMING MAINTENANCE**

OPEN DATE MONDAY, JULY 9, 2018 AT 11:00 A.M. CENTRAL TIME	BIDDER'S NAME ADDRESS	CHRIS MANTELL INC. DBA COASTAL MAINTENANCE P.O. BOX 1933 FRIENDSWOOD, TX 77549	D & N CONTRACTORS, INC. 1323 CR 36 ANGLETON, TX 77515	CAHABA DISASTER RECOVERY, LLC 2903 7TH STREET TUSCALOOSA, AL 35401-1809	ASPLUNDH TREE EXPERT, LLC 3501 NORTH OSAGE DRIVE TULSA, OK 74127
	QUOTED BY: TELEPHONE NUMBER: FAX NUMBER: EMAIL:	TRAVIS MANTELL 281-482-3343 281-482-3411 TRAVIS@COASTALMAINTENANCE.NET	LARRY NOVAK 832-228-5712 RLCICERO@SBCGLOBAL.NET	ALBERT J. ISAKSON 205-722-2142 205-722-2667 DRCAJI@AOL.COM	SCOTT BAILEY 918-437-4800 918-794-5163 SBAILEY@ASPLUNDH.COM
1.0 COST TO PROVIDE TREE TRIMMING MAINTENANCE FOR THE NORTH, SOUTH, CENTRAL AND WEST SERVICE CENTER LOCATIONS AS DESCRIBED HEREIN:					
Contractor shall provide sufficient equipment for all trimming maintenance work for the North, South, Central and West Service Centers. This shall include all necessary (not limited to pickup trucks all with operators) support equipment / staff (flaggers) at no additional charge to the County.					
COST PRICE PER EACH HOUR		\$150.00	NO BID	\$700.00	\$750.00 per hour
1.1 Total number of units (minimum 4) with operators assigned to this contract		4		4	4 units, 8 operators
1.2 Total number of ½ Ton pickups with operators assigned to this contract		4		4	4 units, 8 operators
2.0 COST TO PROVIDE TREE TRIMMING MAINTENANCE FOR SOUTH SERVICE CENTER AS DESCRIBED HEREIN:					
Contractor shall provide sufficient equipment for all trimming maintenance work for the South Service Center. This shall include all necessary (not limited to pickup trucks all with operators) support equipment / staff (flaggers) at no additional charge to the County.					
COST PRICE PER EACH HOUR		\$141.00	NO BID	\$400.00	\$375.00 per hour
2.1 Total number of units (minimum 2) with operators assigned to this contract		2		2	2 units, 4 operators
2.2 Total number of ½ Ton pickups with operators assigned to this contract		2		2	2 units, 4 operators
3.0 COST TO PROVIDE TREE TRIMMING MAINTENANCE FOR NORTH SERVICE CENTER AS DESCRIBED HEREIN:					
Contractor shall provide sufficient equipment for all trimming maintenance work for the North Service Center. This shall include all necessary (not limited to pickup trucks all with operators) support equipment / staff (flaggers) at no additional charge to the County.					
COST PRICE PER EACH HOUR		\$141.00	NO BID	\$400.00	\$375.00 per hour
3.1 Total number of units (minimum 2) with operators assigned to this contract		2		2	2 units, 4 operators
3.2 Total number of ½ Ton pickups with operators assigned to this contract		2		2	2 units, 4 operators
4.0 COST TO PROVIDE TREE TRIMMING MAINTENANCE FOR WEST SERVICE CENTER AS DESCRIBED HEREIN:					
Contractor shall provide sufficient equipment for all trimming maintenance work for the West Service Center. This shall include all necessary (not limited to pickup trucks all with operators) support equipment / staff (flaggers) at no additional charge to the County.					
COST PRICE PER EACH HOUR		\$150.00	\$145.00	\$700.00	\$750.00 per hour
4.1 Total number of units (minimum 4) with operators assigned to this contract		2	4	4	4 units, 8 operators
4.2 Total number of ½ Ton pickups with operators assigned to this contract		2	1	4	4 units, 8 operators
5.0 COST TO PROVIDE TREE TRIMMING MAINTENANCE FOR CENTRAL SERVICE CENTER AS DESCRIBED HEREIN:					
Contractor shall provide sufficient equipment for all trimming maintenance work for the Central Service Center. This shall include all necessary (not limited to pickup trucks all with operators) support equipment / staff (flaggers) at no additional charge to the County.					
COST PRICE PER EACH HOUR		\$150.00	NO BID	\$700.00	\$750.00 per hour
5.1 Total number of units (minimum 4) with operators assigned to this contract		4		4	4 units, 8 operators
5.2 Total number of ½ Ton pickups with operators assigned to this contract		4		4	4 units, 8 operators